

From: [Sherry Groeschl](#)
To: [Purchasing: Web Master](#)
Subject: IDL ITB 18-203 Planting - INTENT TO AWARD
Date: Wednesday, January 31, 2018 9:01:40 AM

To All Planting ITB Respondents,
Due to overall confusion on how to fill out the 2019 Schedule A, and its subsequent evaluation and award, IDL has determined it is in its best interest to Award the contract based solely on the 2018 proposed values, as shown in the attached. The contract term will change from a one year with option to renew for one year to an expiration date of 12/31/18. We will re-solicit for 2019.

Attached are the bid results for IDL ITB 18-203 for the 2018 planting projects.

Your bids have been received and considered. This correspondence is your Intent to Award Notification to the following contractors for the following areas:

Pend Oreille – Alpha Services

St. Joe – Faith Forestry

Ponderosa – Alpha Services

Clearwater – Alpha Services

Priest Lake (Fall) – ~~OC Forestry~~ Editor's note: OC Forestry declined; contract awarded to next lowest bidder - Alpha Services

Note: This is not a contract award. This is a Notice of Intent to Award only. Final contract documents will be issued at a later date.

Please contact me at 208-666-8619 if you have any questions. Thank you for your participation and interest in supplying the needs of the State of Idaho.

Sherry Groeschl

Senior Buyer

Idaho Department of Lands

3284 W Industrial Loop

Coeur d'Alene, ID 83815

sgroeschl@idl.idaho.gov

208.769.1525 ext 8619 Main Line

208.666.8619 Direct

18-203 BID RESULTS

SPRING PLANTING 2018						TOVAR'S REFORESTATION	
SUPERVISORY AREA	PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER	UNIT TYPE	QUANTITY OF ITEMS	MINIMUM DAILY PRODUCTION	TOOL REQUIRED	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Pend Orielle	POL 2018 Spring Planting 20-905-102-18	Trees	80,700	20,000	Hoedad	\$0.3500	\$28,245.0000
PEND OREILLE TOTAL						PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$28,245.0000
St. Joe	2018 St. Joe Spring Planting 30-768-102-18	Trees	269,000	7,000 (unit 5,7,8,10,12-14) 15,000 (other)	Any	\$0.3500	\$94,150.0000
		Trees	20,000		Shovel	\$0.4000	\$8,000.0000
ST JOE TOTAL						ST JOE TOTAL	\$102,150.0000
Ponderosa	Ponderosa Spring Plant 2018 41-268-102-18	Trees	385,000	25,000	Hoedad	\$0.3000	\$115,500.0000
PONDEROSA TOTAL						PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$115,500.0000
Clearwater	CLW Spring Plant & Tube 2018 40-1244-102-18	Trees (units 1-13)	43,820	7500 (unit 2,4,8,9,14-18) 15,000 (other)	Hoedad	\$0.3400	\$14,898.8000
		Trees (units 1-13)	160,810		Shovel	\$0.3800	\$61,107.8000
		Trees (units 14-18)	112,050		Shovel	\$0.3800	\$42,579.0000
		Tubes-Additional Cost	44,000	7,500		\$0.4600	\$20,240.0000
CLEARWATER TOTAL						CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$138,825.6000

FALL PLANTING 2018						TOVAR'S REFORESTATION	
SUPERVISORY AREA	PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER	UNIT TYPE	QUANTITY OF ITEMS	MINIMUM DAILY PRODUCTION	TOOL REQUIRED	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
Priest Lake	Priest Lake Fall Plant 2018 10-640-102-18	Trees	153,200	20,000	Hoedad	\$0.3600	\$55,152.0000
PRIEST LAKE FALL PLANTING TOTAL						TOTAL	\$55,152.0000

18-203 BID RESULTS

	ALPHA SERVICES		FAITH FORESTRY		5-STAR FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Pend Orielle	\$0.1670	\$13,476.9000	\$0.1800	\$14,526.0000	NO BID	No Bid
	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$13,476.9000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$14,526.0000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	No Bid
St. Joe	\$0.1840	\$49,496.0000	\$0.1800	\$48,420.0000	\$0.2800	\$75,320.0000
	\$0.1900	\$3,800.0000	\$0.2300	\$4,600.0000	\$0.2900	\$5,800.0000
	ST JOE TOTAL	\$53,296.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$53,020.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$81,120.0000
Ponderosa	\$0.1678	\$64,603.0000	\$0.1800	\$69,300.0000	\$0.2900	\$111,650.0000
	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$64,603.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$69,300.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$111,650.0000
Clearwater	\$0.1799	\$7,883.2180	\$0.1800	\$7,887.6000	\$0.2800	\$12,269.6000
	\$0.1799	\$28,929.7190	\$0.2500	\$40,202.5000	\$0.2900	\$46,634.9000
	\$0.2078	\$23,283.9900	\$0.3500	\$39,217.5000	\$0.2900	\$32,494.5000
	\$0.3740	\$16,456.0000	\$0.3000	\$13,200.0000	\$0.3400	\$14,960.0000
	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$76,552.9270	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$100,507.6000	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$106,359.0000

	ALPHA SERVICES		FAITH FORESTRY		5-STAR FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Priest Lake	\$0.1860	\$28,495.2000	\$0.3500	\$53,620.0000	NO BID	No Bid
	TOTAL	\$28,495.2000	TOTAL	\$53,620.0000	TOTAL	No Bid

2nd lowest bid

18-203 BID RESULTS

	JOI FORESTRY		SPROUT FORESTRY		SUMMIT FORESTS	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Pend Orielle	\$0.1800	\$14,526.0000	\$0.2600	\$20,982.0000	\$0.4900	\$39,543.0000
	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$14,526.0000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$20,982.0000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$39,543.0000
St. Joe	\$0.2300	\$61,870.0000	\$0.3400	\$91,460.0000	\$0.5000	\$134,500.0000
	\$0.1900	\$3,800.0000	\$0.3400	\$6,800.0000	\$0.4400	\$8,800.0000
	ST JOE TOTAL	\$65,670.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$98,260.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$143,300.0000
Ponderosa	\$0.1900	\$73,150.0000	\$0.2100	\$80,850.0000	\$0.4800	\$184,800.0000
	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$73,150.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$80,850.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$184,800.0000
Clearwater	\$0.2700	\$11,831.4000	\$0.3300	\$14,460.6000	\$0.5200	\$22,786.4000
	\$0.2700	\$43,418.7000	\$0.3300	\$53,067.3000	\$0.5200	\$83,621.2000
	\$0.1900	\$21,289.5000	\$0.3300	\$36,976.5000	\$0.6000	\$67,230.0000
	\$0.2900	\$12,760.0000	\$0.3800	\$16,720.0000	\$0.6000	\$26,400.0000
	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$89,299.6000	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$121,224.4000	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$200,037.6000

	JOI FORESTRY		SPROUT FORESTRY		SUMMIT FORESTS	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Priest Lake	\$0.1900	\$29,108.0000	\$0.3000	\$45,960.0000	\$0.4400	\$67,408.0000
	TOTAL	\$29,108.0000	TOTAL	\$45,960.0000	TOTAL	\$67,408.0000

18-203 BID RESULTS

	EARTH INDUSTRIES		LG FORESTRY		OC FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Pend Orielle	\$0.1900	\$15,333.0000	\$0.2200	\$17,754.0000	\$0.1698	\$13,702.8600
	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$15,333.0000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$17,754.0000	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$13,702.8600
St. Joe	\$0.3900	\$104,910.0000	\$0.3200	\$86,080.0000	\$0.4500	\$121,050.0000
	\$0.3900	\$7,800.0000	\$0.3200	\$6,400.0000	\$0.4500	\$9,000.0000
	ST JOE TOTAL	\$112,710.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$92,480.0000	ST JOE TOTAL	\$130,050.0000
Ponderosa	\$0.2000	\$77,000.0000	\$0.2100	\$80,850.0000	\$0.2000	\$77,000.0000
	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$77,000.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$80,850.0000	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$77,000.0000
Clearwater	\$0.2000	\$8,764.0000	\$0.2500	\$10,955.0000	\$0.2500	\$10,955.0000
	\$0.3600	\$57,891.6000	\$0.2500	\$40,202.5000	\$0.4500	\$72,364.5000
	\$0.3600	\$40,338.0000	\$0.2500	\$28,012.5000	\$0.4500	\$50,422.5000
	\$0.3600	\$15,840.0000	\$0.4000	\$17,600.0000	\$0.4500	\$19,800.0000
	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$122,833.6000	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$96,770.0000	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$153,542.0000

	EARTH INDUSTRIES		LG FORESTRY		OC FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Priest Lake	\$0.1900	\$29,108.0000	\$0.3200	\$49,024.0000	\$0.1698	\$26,013.3600
	TOTAL	\$29,108.0000	TOTAL	\$49,024.0000	TOTAL	\$26,013.3600

Declined

18-203 BID RESULTS

PROGRESSIVE FORESTRY		
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Pend Orielle	\$0.1999	\$16,131.9300
	PEND OREILLE TOTAL	\$16,131.9300
St. Joe	\$0.2299	\$61,843.1000
	\$0.2299	\$4,598.0000
	ST JOE TOTAL	\$66,441.1000
Ponderosa	\$0.1869	\$71,956.5000
	PONDEROSA TOTAL	\$71,956.5000
Clearwater	\$0.2333	\$10,223.2060
	\$0.2633	\$42,341.2730
	\$0.4633	\$51,912.7650
	\$0.3600	\$15,840.0000
	CLEARWATER TOTAL	\$120,317.2440

PROGRESSIVE FORESTRY		
SUPERVISORY AREA	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
Priest Lake	\$0.2220	\$34,010.4000
	TOTAL	\$34,010.4000