PROJECT NO.20-207 EVALUATION SHEET
2020 ROADSIDE SPRAY

Summitt Forests, Inc
Ashland, Oregon

Custom Spray Service Inc
Spokane, Washington

Quality Services, Inc.
Spirit Lake, Idaho

Vegetation Management Services
Hagerman, Idaho

Woodland Resource Services, Inc
Ellensburg, WA

Devlin Farms, LLC
Brooksville, Florida

SUPERVISORY PROJECT NAME Allocation Per Milel NUMBER | UNIT | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED
AREA AND NUMBER Total Allocation | OF UNITS| TYPE UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT

Priest Lake PL Roadside Spray 2020 $162.00 $1,306.00 $158.35 NO BID NO BID $207.50 $265.00
10-679-228-20 $14,100.00 87 MILE $ 113,622.00 $ 13,776.45 $ - $ 18,052.50 $ 23,055.00

Pend Oreille Lake POL 20 Roadside Spray $100.00 $889.00 $50.00 $66.00 $69.25 $95.00 $175.00
20-960-228-20 $13,100.00 130 MILE $ 115,570.00 $ 6,500.00 $ 8,580.00 $ 9,002.50 $ 12,350.00 $ 22,750.00

Mica Mica Roadside Spray 2020 $100.00 $889.00 $50.00 $68.00 $69.25 $116.50 $175.00
20-195-228-20 $5,100.00 51 MILE $ 45,339.00 $ 2,550.00 $ 3,468.00 $ 3,531.75 $ 5,941.50 $ 8,925.00

St Joe 2020 St Joe Roadside Spray |$161.68 $998.00 $50.00 NO BID NO BID $77.00 $175.00
30-783-228-20 $27,000.00 167 MILE $ 166,666.00 $ 8,350.00 $ - $ - $ 12,859.00 $ 29,225.00
TOTAL $ 441,197.00 $ 31,176.45 $ 12,048.00 $ 12,534.25 $ 49,203.00 $ 83,955.00




	Evaluation Sheet

