
SUPERVISORY AREA NUMBER UNIT PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER

OF UNITS TYPE UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

1 $6,774.00 $6,575.00 $7,050.00 $6,737.00

1 $109.00 $179.00 $240.00 $122.00

1 Each $488.00 $704.00 $421.00 $466.00

1 $35.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1,200.00

1 $6,774.00 $7,050.00 $6,737.00

1 $109.00 $240.00 $122.00

1 $35.00 $100.00 $1,300.00

1 $6,774.00 $7,050.00 $6,737.00

1 $109.00 $240.00 $122.00

1 Each $35.00 $100.00 $1,300.00

1 $6,774.00 $7,050.00 $6,737.00

1 $109.00 $240.00 $122.00

1 $35.00 $100.00 $1,300.00

1 $8,224.00 $8,645.00 $8,245.00

1 included $240.00 $40.00

1 $39.00 $140.00 $156.00

1 $199.00 $290.00 $205.90

1 $149.00 $165.00 $40.00

1 $448.00 $421.00 $400.15

1 $69.00 $165.00 $130.30

1 $99.00 $165.00 $107.20

1 $35.00 $100.00 $1,300.00

1 $8,470.00

1 $61.00

1 $1,300.00

`

1 Each $9,724.00 $9,672.00 $10,299.00 $9,570.00

1 $125.00 $126.00 $170.00 $150.00

1 $125.00 $126.00 $170.00 $150.00

1 $329.00 $336.00 $420.00 $334.00

1 $299.00 $252.00 $320.00 $261.00

1 $125.00 $126.00 $203.00 $190.00

1 $449.00 $370.00 $533.00 $365.50

1 $79.00 $77.00 $95.00 $107.00

1 $349.00 $315.00 $423.00 $311.00

1 $299.00 $318.00 $519.00 $358.00

1 $279.00 $228.00 $349.00 $240.00

1 Each $0.00 $0.00 $150.00 $850.00

16-279 - Payette Lakes - Total

16-285 - Clearwater - Total

16-286 - Clearwater - Total

16-287 - Clearwater - Total

16-353 - Maggie Creek - Total

16-354 - Ponderosa - Total

16-451 - Southwest - Total

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Each

Winch Mount Bracket 279.00$                           228.00$                        349.00$                        240.00$                        

Winch 299.00$                           318.00$                        519.00$                        358.00$                        

79.00$                             77.00$                          95.00$                          107.00$                        

72" Straight Plow Blade 349.00$                           315.00$                        423.00$                        311.00$                        

Ponderosa                   
16-354  

CANCELLED

10,299.00$                   9,672.00$                     2016 Honda Pioneer 7000 UTV

Southwest                      
16-451

-$                             

-$                             

Plow Push Tube 449.00$                           370.00$                        533.00$                        

Rubber Bed Mat 2P

Delivery to 913 3rd St, Kamiah, ID 35.00$                             -$                             100.00$                        1,300.00$                     

A-Arm Guards, Rear 99.00$                             -$                             165.00$                        107.20$                        

A-Arm Guards, Front 69.00$                             -$                             165.00$                        130.30$                        

Each2500 LB Winch w/mounting kit 448.00$                           -$                             421.00$                        400.15$                        

6,918.00$                         

-$                             

35.00$                             

165.00$                        

EachFrame Skid Plate 199.00$                           -$                             290.00$                        

EachRear Frame Skid Plate 149.00$                           -$                             

REQUEST FOR QUOTE NO. 16-279, 16-285, 16-286, 16-287, 16-353, 16-354, 16-451 EVALUATION SHEET
 FY16 ATVs/UTVs

240.00$                        122.00$                        

Clearwater                 
16-285                        
16-286                        
16-287

EachRecoil Starter Kit, Installed (16-287) 109.00$                           240.00$                        122.00$                        

6,918.00$                         

488.00$                           704.00$                        421.00$                        

EachRecoil Starter Kit, Installed 109.00$                           179.00$                        

10,331.00$                   10,624.55$                   

8,159.00$                     7,390.00$                     

7,390.00$                     8,159.00$                     

8,159.00$                     7,390.00$                     

8,245.00$                     

156.00$                        

1,300.00$                     

205.90$                        

40.00$                          

9,831.00$                     

12,886.50$                   13,651.00$                   

No Bid

170.00$                        150.00$                        

261.00$                        320.00$                        

365.50$                        

7,558.00$                     7,811.00$                     8,525.00$                     

-$                             

-$                             

No Bid

-$                             100.00$                        1,300.00$                     

240.00$                        122.00$                        

100.00$                        1,300.00$                     

12,182.00$                       

9,262.00$                         

Maggie Creek              
16-353

-$                             

-$                             

No Bid

126.00$                        

252.00$                        

11,946.00$                   

No Bid

Plow Mount 125.00$                           126.00$                        

EachHard Roof 2P 299.00$                           

Each

125.00$                           

Each

EachAluminum A-Arm Guards, Front 125.00$                           

Front Bumper 329.00$                           336.00$                        420.00$                        

7,406.00$                         

Payette Lakes            
16-279

Each2016 Artic Cat Alterra 500 -$                                 

6,918.00$                         

Recoil Starter Kit, Installed (16-286)

Delivery to 10230 Hwy 12, Orofino, ID 35.00$                             

2016 Honda Fourtrax Rancher (16-286)

109.00$                           

8,224.00$                         

39.00$                             

Each

Each

Each

Each

Winch w/Mounting Kit, installed

-$                             

No Bid

No Bid

100.00$                        

-$                             

-$                             

-$                             240.00$                        40.00$                          

126.00$                        

9,724.00$                         

Each

-$                             

No Bid

EachAluminum A-Arm Guards, Rear

100.00$                        1,200.00$                     

Recoil Starter Kit, Installed (16-285)

Delivery to 10230 Hwy 12, Orofino, ID

2016 Honda Fourtrax Rancher (16-287) 6,774.00$                         

7,050.00$                     -$                             Each 6,774.00$                         

Each 109.00$                           

Each 35.00$                             

PowerSports Plus
Albany, GA

6,737.00$                     

9,570.00$                     

TOTAL EXTENDED

AMOUNT

6,737.00$                     

6,737.00$                     

466.00$                        

8,470.00$                     

61.00$                          

6,737.00$                     

150.00$                        170.00$                        

240.00$                        122.00$                        

140.00$                        

8,645.00$                     

-$                             1,300.00$                     

334.00$                        

203.00$                        190.00$                        

TOTAL EXTENDED

 AND PROJECT NUMBER AMOUNT

COMMODITY NAME 

-$                             

-$                             

Mac's Cycle
Clarkston, WA

TOTAL EXTENDED

AMOUNT

7,050.00$                     

7,050.00$                     

7,050.00$                     

6,575.00$                     

Delivery to 555 Deinhard Ln, McCall, ID 35.00$                             

AMOUNT

Each

EachHeated Grips -$                                 

Delivery to 3130 Hwy 3, Deary, ID -$                                 -$                             

100.00$                        

Delivery to 10230 Hwy 12, Orofino, ID

Heated Grips

2016 Honda Fourtrax Rubicon DCT-EPS

Front and Rear Cargo Racks -$                                 

Delivery to 8355 W State St, Boise ID  83714 -$                                 -$                             150.00$                        850.00$                        

Each

Each

Each

Honda Fourtrax Rancher 6,774.00$                         

2016 Honda Fourtrax Rancher (16-285) 6,774.00$                         

Each

Canyon Honda
Nampa ID

Carl's Cycle Sales
Boise, ID

TOTAL EXTENDED
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