IDL ITB 18-204 PreCommercial Thinning, Pruning, Cull Removal and Slashing

AREA PROJECT

Priest Lake

VENDOR
5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc

LG Forestry

Lara Brothers LTD

OC Forestry

Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC

Pend Oreille

PROJECT
CANCELLED

5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC

Mica 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC

St Joe 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC
Clearwater 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC
Maggie Creek 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC
Ponderosa 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC
Payette Lakes 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC
Southwest 5 Star Forestry
Alpha Services
GE Forestry Inc.
JOI Forest Inc
LG Forestry
Lara Brothers LTD
OC Forestry
Sprout Forestry
Summit Forests Inc
White Pine Forestry LLC

BID SUMMARY SHEET

2017 Total 2018 Total
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

$78,780.00 $58,943.00

$82,820.00 $61,983.00
$111,100.00 $86,105.00
No Bid No Bid
Incomplete Bid $86,030.00
$108,272.00 $83,994.00
$100,596.00 $77,070.00
$140,996.00 $105,248.00
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$94,855.00 $110,618.00
$89,765.00 $104,958.00
$98,005.00 $124,935.00
No Bid No Bid
$89,070.00 $107,885.00
$98,842.00 $118,144.00
$123,641.00 $144,380.00
$104,401.00 $141,718.00
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
$37,635.00 $88,193.00
$39,565.00 $92,733.00
$43,425.00 $106,345.00
No Bid No Bid
$38,600.00 $90,530.00
$40,144.00 $98,734.00
$31,459.00 $75,570.00
$55,005.00 $131,008.00
No Bid No Bid
$211,972.00 $237,504.00
$ 129,120.00 $144,488.00
$ 134,500.00 $150,528.00
$ 158,710.00 $183,645.00
No Bid No Bid
$153,330.00 $171,535.00
$160,324.00 $185,474.00
$101,682.00 $116,670.00
$216,588.00 $216,588.00
$52,650.00 $108,715.00
$55,380.00 $133,000.00
$34,710.00 $71,621.00
$32,760.00 $67,586.00
$50,700.00 $108,630.00
No Bid No Bid
$26,910.00 $56,446.00
$48,360.00 $111,824.00
$31,590.00 $66,870.00
$34,905.00 $116,508.00
No Project $108,715.00
No Project $133,000.00
No Project $78,443.00
No Project $82,483.00
No Project $98,615.00
No Project No Bid
No Project $112,510.00
No Project $111,834.00
No Project $102,470.00
No Project $132,548.00
$196,135.00 $116,715.00
$149,234.75 $133,015.00
$146,721.00 $78,426.00
$154,091.00 $82,466.00
$182,245.00 $114,670.00
$181,900.00 Incomplete Bid
$141,440.00 $88,499.00
$174,746.00 $111,834.00
$132,817.00 $80,070.00
$243,210.00 $132,548.00
No Bid No Bid
$30,084.60 $22,031.00
$24,164.00 $7,118.00
$27,244.00 $7,928.00
$18,228.00 $11,667.00
No Bid No Bid
$24,304.00 $7,918.00
$18,424.00 $11,908.00
$32,550.00 $15,164.00
$67,872.00 $20,889.00
No Bid No Bid
$98,405.40 $411,120.00
$70,576.00 $132,078.00
$78,596.00 $147,088.00
$57,744.00 Incomplete Bid
No Bid No Bid
$64,160.00 $120,078.00
$54,536.00 Incomplete Bid
$97,042.00 $184,704.00
$127,518.00 $330,125.00

2019 Total
No Bid
No Bid
$78,443.00
$82,483.00
$118,635.00
No Bid
$116,535.00
$119,821.00
$ 104,488.00
$ 140,148.00

No Bid
No Bid
$110,618.00
$ 104,928.00
$ 130,615.00
No Bid
$110,715.00
$ 123,824.00
$ 147,223.00
$ 141,718.00

No Bid
No Bid
$80,393.00
$84,533.00
$101,075.00
No Bid
$82,530.00
$98,244.00
$70,588.00
$119,408.00

No Bid
$261,014.00
$144,488.00
$150,528.00
$189,675.00

No Bid
$171,535.00
$185,494.00
$119,088.00
$216,588.00

$73,215.00
$83,530.00
$44,921.00
$42,386.00
$70,660.00
No Bid
$35,446.00
$75,154.00
$42,888.00
$73,008.00

$68,215.00
$83,551.00
$49,193.00
$51,733.00
$64,395.00
No Bid
$71,765.00
$75,164.00
$65,638.00
$83,048.00

$145,715.00
$166,079.00
$97,926.00
$102,966.00
$148,200.00
Incomplete Bid
$115,499.00
$149,664.00
$101,888.00
$165,548.00

No Bid
$22,038.00
$7,118.00
$7,928.00
$12,477.00
No Bid
$7,918.00
$12,718.00
$15,408.00
$20,889.00

No Bid
$137,146.00
$44,078.00
$49,088.00

Incomplete Bid

No Bid

$40,078.00
Incomplete Bid

$63,208.00
$110,125.00

Total Bid
No Bid
No Bid

$216,166.00
$227,286.00
$315,840.00
$0.00
NON-Responsive
$312,087.00
$282,154.00
$386,392.00

$0.00

$0.00
$316,091.00
$299,651.00
$353,555.00

No Bid
$307,670.00
$340,810.00
$415,244.00
$387,837.00

No Bid
No Bid
$206,221.00
$216,831.00
$250,845.00
No Bid
$211,660.00
$237,122.00
$177,617.00
$305,421.00

No Bid
$710,490.00
$418,096.00
$435,556.00
$532,030.00

No Bid
$496,400.00
$531,292.00
$337,440.00
$649,764.00

$234,580.00
$271,910.00
$151,252.00
$142,732.00
$229,990.00
No Bid
$118,802.00
$235,338.00
$141,348.00
$224,421.00

$176,930.00
$216,551.00
$127,636.00
$134,216.00
$163,010.00
No bid
$184,275.00
$186,998.00
$168,108.00
$215,596.00

$458,565.00
$448,328.75
$323,073.00
$339,523.00
$445,115.00
Non-Responsive
$345,438.00
$436,244.00
$314,775.00
$541,306.00

No Bid
$74,153.60
$38,400.00
$43,100.00
$42,372.00

No Bid
$40,140.00
$43,050.00
$63,122.00
$109,650.00

No Bid
$646,671.40
$246,732.00
$274,772.00

Non-Responsive

No Bid

$224,316.00
Non-Responsive

$344,954.00

$567,768.00



2017 PROJECT BIDS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 18-204

PRECOMMERCIAL THINNING, PRUNING, CULL REMOVAL, & SLASHING

5 Star Forestr;

Alpha Services

GE Forestry

JOI Forest Inc.

LG Forestry

Lara Brothers LTD

OC Forestry Inc

Sprout Forestry Inc

Summit Forests Inc

White Pine Forestry LLC

Kooskia ID Orofino, ID Central Point, OR Medford, OR Central Point, OR Castlerock, WA Medford, OR Central Point, OR Ashland, OR Nampa, ID
2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017 2017FIXED | TOTAL 2017
SUPERVSORY | proseCT NAME AND NuMBER | TREATHENT | APPROXMATE | yirprices | esTivaTeD | APPROXMATE |y prices | esTivatep | APCROXMATE | N prices | EsTiMaTeD | APPSOXMATE | ynirpricer | EsTiaTED | APPROXMATE | ynirprices | estivatep | APPROXMATE |y prices | esimatep | APPROXMATE | i pricer | EsTiaTED | APPSOXMATE | ynirpricer | estivaten | APPROXMATE | ynirprices | esTivatep | ATCROXMATE | ynim prices | EsTIMATED
RS ACRE AMOUNT s ACRE AMOUNT RS ACRE AMOUNT s ACRE AMOUNT RS ACRE AMOUNT s ACRE AMOUNT RS ACRE AMOUNT s ACRE AMOUNT RS ACRE AMOUNT s ACRE AMOUNT
Priest Lakue ;:;""ng 2017 Thinning 404 $0.00 $0.00 404 $0.00 $0.00 404 $195.00 $78,780.00 404 $205.00 $62,820.00 404 $275.00 $111,100.00 404 $0.00 $0.00 404 $285.00 $115,140.00 404 $268.00 $108,272.00 404 $249.00 $100,596.00 404 $349.00 $140,996.00
FM## 10 -112-17
Priest Lake Pruning 0 $0.00 50.00 o $0.00 $0.00 0 $85.00 $0.00 o $95.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00 [} $263.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00
For pwp‘;f:]gg‘:’;z‘:'e future i and Prune 0 $0.00 50.00 o $0.00 $0.00 0 $280.00 $0.00 o $300.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00 ) $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 o 50.00 50.00 0 $390.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00 [} $78.00 $0.00 [ $88.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 $0.00 ) $200.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00
Priest Lake Totals 50.00 $0.00 s 78.780.00 $ 8282000 s 111,100.00 50.00 $115,140.00 $108,272.00 $100,596.00 $140,996.00
Thinning 439 $0.00 $0.00 439 $0.00 $0.00 439 $195.00 $65,605.00 439 $185.00 $81,215.00 439 $195.00 $65,605.00 439 $0.00 $0.00 439 $180.00 $79,020.00 439 $198.00 $86,922.00 439 $249.00 $109,311.00 439 $219.00 $96,141.00
POL 2017 PCT and Prune Pruning 10 $0.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 10 $85.00 $850.00 10 $75.00 $750.00 10 $145.00 $1.450.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 10 $0.00 $0.00 10 $148.00 $1,480.00 10 $263.00 $2,630.00 10 $79.00 $790.00
Pend Oreille FM # 20-008-112-17 Thin and Prune 30 $0.00 50.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 30 $280.00 $8,400.00 30 $260.00 $7,800.00 30 $365.00 $10,950.00 30 $0.00 $0.00 30 $335.00 $10,050.00 30 $348.00 $10,440.00 30 $390.00 $11,700.00 30 $249.00 $7,470.00
For purpose of establishing rates | - ¢ gemoyey 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $78.00 $0.00 4 $68.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $80.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00 0 $200.00 $0.00 [ $0.00 $0.00
for possible future projects
Pend Oreille Totals $0.00 $0.00 S 94,855.00 $  89,765.00 S 98,005.00 $0.00 Non-Responsive $89,070.00 $98,842.00 $123,641.00 $104,401.00
F;a::':; :’;121021; Thinning 193 $0.00 $0.00 193 $0.00 000 193 $195.00 $37,635.00 193 $205.00 $39,565.00 193 $225.00 $43,425.00 193 $0.00 $0.00 193 $200.00 $38,600.00 193 $208.00 $40,144.00 193 $163.00 $31,459.00 193 $285.00 $55,005.00
Mica ) Pruning 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $85.00 $0.00 0 $95.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $263.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
F°'{§r”;‘;°;;b‘l’; fotre pmiecz"es Thin and Prune 0 $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 0 $280.00 $0.00 0 $300.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $390.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $78.00 $0.00 0 $68.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $200.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
Mica Totals $0.00 $0.00 $ 3763500 $ 3956500 $ 4342500 $0.00 $368,600.00 $40,144.00 $31,459.00 $55,005.00
F:ﬁlﬁj‘;i’z; Thinning 538 $0.00 $0.00 538 $394.00 $211,972.00 538 $240.00 $120,120.00 538 $250.00 $134,500.00 538 $295.00 $158,710.00 538 $0.00 $0.00 538 $285.00 $153,330.00 538 $298.00 $160,324.00 538 $189.00 $101,682.00 538 $349.00 $187,762.00
St. Joe ) Pruning 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $300.00 50.00 0 $85.00 $0.00 o $95.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $263.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
F°'{§:‘;‘;"sssieb‘l’; fotre proiEE[:'es Thin and Prune 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $694.00 $0.00 0 $325.00 $0.00 o $345.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 $0.00 0 $390.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $100.00 $0.00 0 $78.00 $0.00 0 $68.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00 0 $200.00 $0.00 o $0.00 5000
St. Joe Totals $0.00 $211,972.00 S 129,120.00 $ 13450000 $  156,710.00 $0.00 $153,330.00 $160,324.00 $101,682.00 $187,762.00
i;": g 515‘2:10112201; Thinning 195 $270.00 $52,650.00 195 $284.00 $55,380.00 195 $178.00 $34,710.00 195 $168.00 $32,760.00 195 $260.00 $50,700.00 195 $0.00 000 195 $138.00 $26,910.00 195 $248.00 $48,360.00 195 $162.00 $31,590.00 195 $179.00 $34,905.00
Clearwater ) Pruning 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $300.00 50.00 0 $85.00 $0.00 0 $75.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $263.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
F°'{§:‘;‘;"sssieb‘l’; fotre pmiEE[:'ES Thin and Prune 0 $0.00 $0.00 o $600.00 50.00 0 $258.00 $0.00 0 $243.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $390.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $100.00 $0.00 0 $78.00 $0.00 0 $68.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $200.00 $0.00 o $0.00 50.00
Clearwater Totals $52,650.00 $55,380.00 s 3471000 $  32,760.00 S 50,700.00 $0.00 $26,910.00 $48,360.00 $31,590.00 $34,905.00
No Projects Scheduled for 2017 Thinning 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $300.00 $0.00 0 $195.00 $0.00 0 $205.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $249.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
Maggie Creek Pruning [} $0.00 $0.00 [ $300.00 $0.00 [} $85.00 $0.00 [ $95.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 o $0.00 $0.00 [} $263.00 $0.00 ) $0.00 $0.00
F""sr”;':)‘f;b‘l’é foture pro]ec{:les Thin and Prune 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $600.00 50.00 0 $280.00 50.00 0 $300.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00 0 $390.00 50.00 0 $0.00 50.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $100.00 50.00 [} $78.00 50.00 0 $88.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 [} $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 [} $200.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
Maggie Creek Totals 50.00 $0.00 s B $0.00 s - $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2007 P“”demsz A'EE:CT North Thinning 260 | $290.00 $78,010.00 269 $199.00 $53,531.00 260 | $195.00 | $52,455.00 269 $205.00 | $55,145.00 269 $275.00 $73,075.00 269 $215.00 $57,835.00 269 $220.00 $59,180.00 269 $268.00 $72,092.00 260 $194.00 $52,186.00 269 $330.00 $88,770.00
FM# 41-271-112-17
2017 P°"dems: Az'ea :CT South Thinning | 261 | $290.00 $75,690.00 261 $243.75 $63,618.75 261 | $220.00 | $67,420.00 261 $230.00 | $60,030.00 261 $280.00 $73,080.00 261 $285.00 $74,385.00 261 $220.00 $67,420.00 261 $268.00 $60,948.00 261 $140.00 $36,540.00 261 $330.00 $86,130.00
FM# 41-272-112-17
Ponderosa 2017 Ponderosa Area PCT Robi
onderosa Area opmson Thinning 207 $205.00 $42,435.00 207 $155.00 $32,085.00 207 $178.00 $36,846.00 207 $188.00 $38,916.00 207 $170.00 $35,190.00 207 $240.00 $49,680.00 207 $120.00 $24,840.00 207 $158.00 $32,706.00 207 $213.00 $44,091.00 207 $330.00 $68,310.00
FM# 41-273-112-17
) Pruning 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $300.00 $0.00 0 $85.00 $0.00 0 $95.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $263.00 $0.00 0 $89.00 $0.00
F°'{§:‘;‘;"sssieb‘l’; fotre pmiEE[:'ES Thin and Prune 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $600.00 $0.00 0 $263.00 $0.00 0 $283.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $390.00 $0.00 0 $370.00 $0.00
Cull Removal 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $100.00 $0.00 0 $78.00 $0.00 0 $88.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $200.00 $0.00 0 $89.00 $0.00
Ponderosa Totals $196,135.00 $149,234.75 S 14672100 $ 15409100 $162,245.00 $181,900.00 $141,440.00 $174,746.00 $132,817.00 $243,210.00
T T T T T
payetts Lakes Olive CTR [ Thinning__| 14 [ so00 $0.00 14 $114.00 $1,596.00 14 [ ssso0 $1,232.00 14 $98.00 $1,372.00 14 | s105.00 $1,470.00 14 | so00 $0.00 14 | ses00 $1,372.00 14 | se800 $1,372.00 14 | s183.00 $2,562.00 14 $249.00 $3,486.00
FM# 50-467-132-17 | cullRemoval | 204 [ so00 $0.00 294 $96.90 $26,488.60 204 [ s7800 $22,932.00 294 $88.00 $25,872.00 204 [ ss7.00 $16,758.00 294 [ so00 $0.00 204 [ s7800 $22,932.00 294 [ ss800 $17,052.00 204 | s102.00 $29,988.00 294 $210.00 $64,386.00
Payette Lakes Totals $0.00 $30,084.60 S 24,164.00 $ 2724400 $18,228.00 $0.00 $24,304.00 $18,424.00 $32,550.00 $67,872.00
T T T T T
S tgao SWI 2017 Thinning [ Thinning__| 802 [ so00 $0.00 802 $122.70 $98,405.40 802 [ ses00 $70576.00 802 $98.00 $78,596.00 802 [ s200 $57,744.00 802 | so00 $0.00 802 | se000 $64,160.00 802 | se800 $54,536.00 802 [ s12100 $97,042.00 802 $150.00 $127,518.00
FM# 60-348-112-17 [ culremoval | 0 [ s000 $0.00 0 $100.00 $0.00 0 [ s7800 $0.00 0 $88.00 $0.00 0 [ s000 $0.00 0 | $0.00 $0.00 0 [ s000 $0.00 0 | $0.00 $0.00 0 | s20000 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00
Southwest Totals $0.00 $98,405.40 s 7057600 $  78596.00 $57,744.00 $0.00 $64,160.00 $54,536.00 $97,042.00 $127,518.00
I T I T I




2018 BIDS

INVITATION TO BID NO. 18-204
PRECOMMERCIAL THINNING, PRUNING, CULL REMOVAL, & SLASHING

5 Star Forestry LLC Alpha Services GE Forestry Inc JOI Forest Inc LG Forestry Lara Brothers LTD OC Forestry Inc. Sprout Forestry Inc Summit Forests Inc. White Pine Forestry LL
Kooskia, ID Orofino, ID Centrl Point, OR Medford, OR Central Point, OR Castle Rock, WA Medford, OR Central Point, OR Ashland, OR Nampa, ID
SUPERVISORY TREATMENT | EsTomrep | 2018FxED | TOTAL2018 | 2 | oowgrixep | ToTALzows [ 208 | coigexep | ToTAL20s | 28 | soigenep | ToTaLzos [ 2018 | oogeixep | TomALzows | PM9 | somgeep | TotAL20s | 28 | soigeep | ToTALzos [ 2088 | ooirxen | ToraLzows [ 28| oomgexep | TorALzows | 29 | soigRxep | TOTAL2018
PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER UNIT PRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ |  ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ |  ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNITPRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNITPRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNITPRICE/ | ESTIMATED UNIT PRICE/ | ESTIMATED
AREA TYPE NUMBER OF MOUNT NUMBER OF AMOUNS NUMBER OF P NUMBER OF AMOUNS NUMBER OF MOUNT NUMBER OF AMOUNS NUMBER OF MOUNT NUMBER OF MO NUMBER OF MOUNT NUMBER OF MO
ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES
2018 Thinning 300 $0.00 000 300 $0.00 $0.00 300 $195.00 $58,500.00 300 $205.00 $61,500.00 300 $285.00 $85,500.00 300 $0.00 $0.00 300 $285.00 $85,500.00 300 $278.00 $83,400.00 300 $254.00 $76,200.00 300 $349.00 $104,700.00
Priest Lake Pruning 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $95.00 $95.00 1 $145.00 $145.00 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $148.00 $148.00 1 $268.00 5268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
For p””“[’j:;fc‘p:’;:':'e future i and Prune 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $280.00 $280.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $365.00 $365.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $330.00 $330.00 1 $348.00 $348.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $370.00 $370.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $95.00 595.00 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $80.00 $80.00 1 $98.00 $98.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Priest Lake Totals $0.00 $0.00 $58,043.00 $61,983.00 $86,105.00 50.00 $86,030.00 $683,994.00 $77,070.00 $105,248.00
o1 Thinning 565 $0.00 50.00 565 $0.00 $0.00 565 $195.00 $110,175.00 565 $185.00 $104,525.00 565 $220.00 $124,300.00 565 $0.00 5000 565 $190.00 $107,350.00 565 $208.00 $117,520.00 565 $254.00 $143,510.00 565 $250.00 $141,250.00
Pruning 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $155.00 $155.00 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 5268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Pend Oreille . . Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $280.00 $280.00 1 $280.00 5280.00 1 $375.00 $375.00 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $335.00 $335.00 1 $358.00 $358.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $290.00 5290.00
or purpose of rates
for possible future projects Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $68.00 $68.00 1 $105.00 $105.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $80.00 $80.00 1 $108.00 $108.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Pend Oreille Totals $0.00 $0.00 $110,618.00 $104,958.00 $124,935.00 $0.00 $107,885.00 $118,144.00 $144,380.00 $141,718.00
2018 Thinning 450 $0.00 $0.00 450 $0.00 $0.00 450 $195.00 $87,750.00 450 $205.00 $92,250.00 450 $235.00 $105,750.00 450 $0.00 $0.00 450 $200.00 $90,000.00 450 $218.00 $98,100.00 450 $166.00 $74,700.00 450 $290.00 $130,500.00
Mica Pruning 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $95.00 $95.00 1 $145.00 $145.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 $268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
F""sr”;':)‘f;b‘l’é foture pro]ec;:les Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $280.00 $280.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $345.00 $345.00 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $330.00 $330.00 1 $358.00 $358.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $330.00 $330.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $105.00 $105.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $80.00 $80.00 1 $118.00 $118.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Mica Totals $50.00 $0.00 $68,193.00 $92,733.00 $106,345.00 $0.00 $90,530.00 $98,734.00 $75,570.00 $131,008.00
2018 Thinning 600 $0.00 $0.00 600 $394.00 $236,400.00 600 $240.00 $144,000.00 600 $250.00 $150,000.00 600 $305.00 $183,000.00 600 $0.00 $0.00 600 $285.00 $171,000.00 600 $308.00 $184,800.00 600 $193.00 $115,800.00 600 $360.00 $216,000.00
St Joe Pruning T $0.00 $0.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $95.00 $95.00 1 $145.00 $145.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 $268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
F""gr”;';‘f;b‘l’é ftire pro]ec;:les Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 50.00 1 $694.00 $694.00 1 $325.00 $325.00 1 $345.00 $345.00 1 $385.00 $385.00 1 $0.00 0.00 1 $330.00 $330.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $410.00 $410.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $110.00 $110.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $115.00 $115.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $118.00 $118.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
St. Joe Totals $0.00 $237,504.00 $144,488.00 $150,528.00 $183,645.00 $0.00 $171,535.00 $185,474.00 $116,670.00 $216,588.00
2018 Thinning 400 $270.00 | $108,000.00 400 $330.00 $132,000.00 400 $178.00 $71,200.00 400 $168.00 $67,200.00 400 $270.00 $108,000.00 400 $0.00 $0.00 400 $140.00 $56,000.00 400 $278.00 $111,200.00 400 $165.00 $66,000.00 400 $290.00 $116,000.00
Clearwater Pruning T $130.00 $130.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $75.00 $75.00 1 $145.00 $145.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $89.00 $89.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 $268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
F""sr”;':)‘f;b‘l’é foture pro]ec;:les Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $600.00 $600.00 1 $258.00 $258.00 1 $243.00 $243.00 1 $360.00 $360.00 1 50.00 50.00 1 $278.00 $278.00 1 $348.00 $348.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $330.00 $330.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 1 $100.00 $100.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $68.00 $68.00 1 $125.00 $125.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $79.00 $79.00 1 $118.00 $118.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Clearwater Totals $108,715.00 $133,000.00 $71,621.00 $67,586.00 $108,630.00 $0.00 $56,446.00 $111,824.00 $66,870.00 $116,508.00
2018 Thinning 400 $270.00 | $108,000.00 400 $330.00 $132,000.00 400 $195.00 $78,000.00 400 $205.00 $682,000.00 400 $245.00 $98,000.00 400 $0.00 $0.00 400 $280.00 $112,000.00 400 $278.00 $111,200.00 400 $254.00 $101,600.00 400 $330.00 $132,000.00
Maggie Creek Pruning 1 $130.00 $130.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $95.00 $95.00 1 $145.00 $145.00 1 50.00 50.00 1 $95.00 595.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 5268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
F°'{§:‘;‘;"sssieb‘l’; fotre proiEE[:'es Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $600.00 $600.00 1 $280.00 $280.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $345.00 $345.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $320.00 $320.00 1 $358.00 $358.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $370.00 $370.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 1 $100.00 $100.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $125.00 $125.00 1 50.00 50.00 1 $95.00 595.00 1 $118.00 $118.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Maggie Creek Totals $108,715.00 $133,000.00 $78,443.00 $62,483.00 $98,615.00 50.00 $112,510.00 $111,834.00 $102,470.00 $132,548.00
2018 Thinning 400 $290.00 | $116,000.00 400 $330.00 $132,000.00 400 $195.00 $78,000.00 400 $205.00 $62,000.00 400 $285.00 $114,000.00 400 $245.00 $98,000.00 400 $220.00 $88,000.00 400 $278.00 $111,200.00 400 $198.00 $79,200.00 400 $330.00 $132,000.00
ponderosa Pruning 1 $130.00 $130.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $85.00 $85.00 1 $95.00 $95.00 1 $170.00 $170.00 1 50.00 50.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $158.00 $158.00 1 $268.00 5268.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
F°'{§:‘;‘;"sssieb‘l’; fotre pmiEE[:'ES Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $600.00 $600.00 1 $263.00 $263.00 1 $283.00 $283.00 1 $370.00 $370.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $300.00 $300.00 1 $358.00 $358.00 1 $398.00 $398.00 1 $370.00 $370.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 1 $115.00 $115.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $130.00 $130.00 1 50.00 50.00 1 $79.00 $79.00 1 $118.00 $118.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
Ponderosa Totals $116,715.00 $133,015.00 $78,426.00 $62,466.00 $114,670.00 Non-Responsive $98,000.00 $88,499.00 $111,834.00 $80,070.00 $132,548.00
2018 Thinning 80 $0.00 50.00 80 $274.00 $21,920.00 80 $88.00 $7,040.00 80 $98.00 $7,840.00 80 $145.00 $11,600.00 80 50.00 50.00 80 $98.00 $7,840.00 80 $148.00 $11,840.00 80 $187.00 $14,960.00 80 $260.00 $20,800.00
Payette Lakes i
v For purpose of establishing rates | - oy Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $111.00 $111.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $67.00 $67.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $68.00 $68.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $89.00 $89.00
for possible future projects
Payette Lakes Totals $0.00 $22,081.00 $7,118.00 $7,928.00 $11,667.00 000 $7,918.00 $11,908.00 $15,164.00 $20,889.00
2018 Thinning 1500 $0.00 $0.00 1500 $274.00 $411,000.00 1500 $88.00 $132,000.00 1500 $98.00 $147,000.00 1500 $92.00 $138,000.00 1500 $0.00 $0.00 1500 $80.00 $120,000.00 1500 $93.00 $139,500.00 1500 $123.00 $184,500.00 1500 $220.00 $330,000.00
SW Idaho
For purpose of establishing rates | ¢ gemoyay 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $120.00 $120.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $88.00 $88.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $78.00 $78.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $204.00 $204.00 1 $125.00 $125.00
for possible future projects
Southwest Totals $0.00 $411,120.00 $132,078.00 $147,088.00 $138,000.00 50.00 $120,078.00 Non-Responsive $139,500.00 $184,704.00 $330,125.00
I I I I I I I I I




2019 BIDS
INVITATION TO BID NO. 18-204
PRECOMMERCIAL THINNING, PRUNING, CULL REMOVAL, & SLASHING

5 Star Forestry LLC

Alpha Services, LLC

GE Forestry Inc

JOI Forest Inc

LG Forestry Inc

Lara Brothers LTD

OC Forestry Inc

Sprout Forestry

Summit Forests Inc

White Pine Forestry LLC

Kooskia, ID Orofino, ID Central Point, OR Medford, OR Central Point, OR Castle Rock, WA Medford, OR Central Point, OR Ashland, OR Nampa, ID
2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019
2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019 2019
SUPERVISORY TREATMENT ESTZIS/Il:’TED 2018’\';'?'5'3 TOTAL 2019 ESTZHOMfTED FIXED |TOTAL 2019 ESEI")"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED |TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESEI")"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019 ESTE'I';"AT FIXED | TOTAL 2019
A PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER Nk NovBER OF | PRI | ESTIMATED | oot e | UNIT |ESTIMATED| =5 | UNIT | ESTIMATED || =2 | UNIT | ESTIMATED | =0 | UNIT | ESTIMATED | =0 | UNIT [ESTIMATED| =0 | UNIT | ESTIMATED | =0 | UNIT | ESTIMATED | =0 | UNIT | ESTIMATED | = | UNIT | ESTIMATED
AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT PRICE/ | AMOUNT
ACRES UCRE ACRES ACRE or ACRE Ok ACRE Ok ACRE Ok ACRE Ok ACRE or ACRE Ok ACRE Ok ACRE
ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES ACRES
2019 Thinning 400 $0.00 $0.00 400 $0.00 $0.00 400 | $195.00 | $ 78,000.00 | 400 | $20500| $ 82,000.00 | 400 | $295.00 | $ 118,000.00 | 400 $0.00 $0.00 400 | $ 290.00 | $116,000.00 | 400 | $298.00 | $ 119,200.00 | 400 | $259.00 | $ 103,600.00 | 400 | $349.00 | $ 139,600.00
Priest Lake ] Pruning 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$8500|$ 8500 1 |s 95008 95.00 1 | $15500]8% 15500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 12000 s 12000 1 |$158.00] $ 158.00 1 | s27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
For p””";fgjgfc tp:’astse'sble future i and Prune 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $280.00 | $  280.00 1 | $30000] $ 300.00 1 [$37500($  375.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 330.00 | $  330.00 1 $358.00 | $ 358.00 1 | $406.00 | $ 406.00 1 |$37000]$ 370.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 78008  78.00 1 |$ 8800|s 88.00 1 |$10500]$  105.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 8s00|s 8500 1 |$105.00 | $ 105.00 1 |s$20800]s 208.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
Priest Lake Totals $0.00 $0.00 $ 78,443.00 $  82483.00 $ 118,635.00 $0.00 $ 116,535.00 $ 119,821.00 $  104,488.00 $ 140,148.00
Thinning 565 $0.00 $0.00 565 $0.00 $0.00 565 | $195.00 | $110,175.00 | 565 | $18500|$ 10452500 | 565 | $230.00 | $ 129,950.00 | 565 $0.00 $0.00 565 | $ 195.00 | $110,175.00 | 565 |$218.00 | $ 123170.00 | 565 | $259.00 | $ 14633500 | 565 | $250.00 | $ 141,250.00
2019 Pruning 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 | $8500|% 8500 1 |s$ 75008 75.00 1 |$16500|% 16500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 12000]$ 12000 1 |$168.00 | $ 168.00 1 |s$27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 8000|8% 89.00
Pend Oreille Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 | $28000|%  280.00 1 | s$26000] s 260.00 1 |$38500]$ 38500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 340008  340.00 1 | $368.00 ] $ 368.00 1 |$406.00 | $ 406.00 1 | $29000 8 290.00
For purpose of establishing rates | o pemoyg) 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 1 $ 68.00 | $ 68.00 1 $115.00 | $  115.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 80.00 | $ 80.00 1 $118.00 | $ 118.00 1 $208.00 | $ 208.00 1 $ 89.00 | $ 89.00
for possible future projects

Pend Oreille Totals $0.00 $0.00 $110,618.00 $ 104,928.00 $ 130,615.00 $0.00 $110,715.00 $ 123,824.00 $ 147,223.00 $ 141,718.00
2019 Thinning 410 $0.00 $0.00 410 $0.00 $0.00 410 | $195.00 | $ 79,950.00 | 410 | $20500 | $ 84,050.00 | 410 | $245.00 | $ 100,450.00 | 410 $0.00 $0.00 410 | $ 20000 | $ 8200000 | 410 |$238.00|$ 97,580.00 | 410 |$170.00 | $ 69,700.00 | 410 | $290.00 | $ 118,900.00
Mica - Pruning 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $ 8500 % 8500 1 |$ 95008 95.00 1 | $15500]$% 15500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 12000]$ 12000 1 | $16800 | $ 168.00 1 | s27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 89008 89.00
Fmﬂfr”;%z?b(l’; fj:if’;';?(‘)?gcges Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $280.00 | $  280.00 1 [ $30000] $ 300.00 1 [$35500 (8%  355.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 33000 | $  330.00 1 $368.00 | $ 368.00 1 | $406.00 | $ 406.00 1 | $330008 330.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 7800|s  78.00 1 |s 8800|s 88.00 1 |$11500]$s 11500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 8000|s 8000 1 |s$12800] $ 128.00 1 |s$20800] s 208.00 1 |$ 89008 89.00
Mica Totals $0.00 $0.00 $ 80,393.00 $  84,533.00 $ 101,075.00 $0.00 $ 82,530.00 $  98,244.00 $  70,588.00 $ 119,408.00
2019 Thinning 600 $0.00 $0.00 600 $433.00 | $259,800.00 | 600 | $240.00 | $144,00000 | 600 | $250.00 | $ 150,000.00 | 600 | $315.00 | $ 189,000.00 | 600 $0.00 $0.00 600 |$ 285.00 | $171,000.00 | 600 |$308.00 | $ 184,800.00 | 600 |$197.00|$ 11820000 | 600 |$360.00|$ 216,000.00
St. Joe - Pruning 1 $0.00 $0.00 $330.00 | $330.00 $ 8500 %  85.00 1 |$ 95008 95.00 1 |$15500(8% 15500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 12000]|8% 12000 1 | $16800 ] $ 168.00 1 |s$27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 8000|8% 89.00
Fo'fg:’;%‘:ieb(l’; fj:j:’e“;':;?gc;‘?es Thin and Prune 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $763.00 | $763.00 1 $325.00 | $  325.00 1 [$34500( 8 345.00 1 [$39500(8%  395.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 330.00 | $  330.00 1 $398.00 | $ 398.00 1 [$406.00 ] 406.00 1 | 410008 410.00
Cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $121.00 | $121.00 1 |$7800]$ 7800 1 |s$ 88008 88.00 1 |$12500(8% 12500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 8so00|$ 8500 1 |[s$12800] $ 128.00 1 |s$20800] s 208.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
St. Joe Totals $0.00 $261,014.00 $144,488.00 $ 150,528.00 $ 189,675.00 $0.00 $ 171,535.00 $ 185494.00 $ 119,088.00 $ 216,588.00
2019 Thinning 250 $290.00 | $72,500.00 250 $330.00 | $82,500.00 | 250 | $178.00 | $ 44,500.00 | 250 | $168.00 | $ 42,000.00 | 250 | $280.00 | $ 70,000.00 | 250 $0.00 $0.00 250 | $ 140.00 | $ 3500000 | 250 |$298.00|% 7450000 | 250 |$168.00 | $ 4200000 | 250 |$290.00|$  72,500.00
Clearwater - Pruning 1 $130.00 $130.00 1 $330.00 | $330.00 1 |$8500]|$ 8500 1 |3 7500 % 75.00 1 |$15500]$% 15500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 8900|s  89.00 1 | $16800 | $ 168.00 1 | s$27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
Forf(')’f;'zf;z?b‘l’; fj:if’;':?(')?gc;:tes Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $600.00 |  $600.00 1 $258.00 | $  258.00 1 [s$24300] 8 243.00 1 [$37000($  370.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 278.00 | $  278.00 1 $358.00 | $ 358.00 1 | $406.00 | $ 406.00 1 | $330008 330.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 $100.00 | $100.00 $ 7800|$  78.00 1 |s 68008 68.00 1 |$13500]$% 13500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 7900|s  79.00 $128.00 | $ 128.00 1 |s$20800] s 208.00 1 |$ 89008 89.00
Clearwater Totals $73,215.00 $83,530.00 $ 44,921.00 $  42,386.00 $ 70,660.00 $0.00 $ 35,446.00 $  75,154.00 $  42,888.00 $  73,008.00
2019 Thinning 250 $270.00 | $67,500.00 250 $330.00 | $82,500.00 | 250 | $195.00 | $ 48,750.00 | 250 |$205.00 | $ 51,5000 | 250 |$255.00|$ 63,750.00 | 250 $0.00 $0.00 250 |$ 28500 | $ 71,250.00 | 250 |$298.00|$ 7450000 | 250 |$259.00|$ 64750.00 | 250 |$33000|$ 8250000
Maggie Creek o Pruning 1 $130.00 $130.00 1 $330.00 | $330.00 1 |$8500]$ 8500 1 |s$ 95008 95.00 1 |$15500(8% 15500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 10000|$  100.00 1 |$16800] $ 168.00 1 |s$27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 8000|8% 89.00
Fo'fg:’;‘;‘ifb?ef ff:f:’e“;':(';gc;?es Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $600.00 |  $600.00 1 $280.00 | $  280.00 1 [$30000]$ 300.00 1 [$35500 (8%  355.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 32000 | $ 320,00 1 $368.00 | $ 368.00 1 [s$406.00 ] 406.00 1 [s$37000](s 370.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 1 $121.00 | $121.00 1 |$7800]$ 7800 1 |s$ 88008 88.00 1 |$13500(% 13500 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 9s00|% 9500 1 |s$12800] $ 128.00 1 |s$20800] s 208.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
Maggie Creek Totals $68,215.00 $83,551.00 $ 49,193.00 $ 51,733.00 $ 64,395.00 $0.00 $ 71,765.00 $  75,164.00 $  65638.00 $  83,048.00
2019 Thinning 500 $290.00 | $145,000.00 500 $330.00 | $165,000.00| 500 | $195.00 | $ 97,500.00 | 500 | $205.00 | $ 102,500.00 | 500 | $295.00 | $ 147,500.00 | 500 | $275.00 | $137,500.00| 500 |$ 230.00 | $115,000.00 | 500 | $298.00 | $ 149,000.00 | 500 | $202.00 | $ 101,000.00 | 500 |$330.00 | $ 165,000.00
Ponderosa - Pruning 1 $130.00 $130.00 $330.00 | $330.00 $ 8500 % 8500 1 |$ 95008 95.00 1 |$18000]$  180.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |$ 12000 s 12000 $168.00 | $ 168.00 1 | s$27400 | s 274.00 1 |$ 80008 89.00
Forf(')’r”;'z;z?bfé fej::rb:;rr‘(')?é’c;?es Thin and Prune 1 $315.00 $315.00 1 $625.00 | $625.00 1 $263.00 | $  263.00 1 |s$28300]( $ 283.00 1 [$38000($  380.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 30000 | $  300.00 1 $368.00 | $ 368.00 1 | $406.00 | $ 406.00 1 |$37000 8% 370.00
Cull Removal 1 $270.00 $270.00 1 $124.00 | $124.00 1 |$ 7800|$ 7800 1 |3 88008 88.00 1 |$14000($  140.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 |s 7900|s  79.00 1 |s$12800] $ 128.00 1 |s$20800] s 208.00 1 |$ 89008 89.00
Ponderosa Totals $145,715.00 $166,079.00 $ 97,926.00 $ 102,966.00 $ 148,200.00 | Non-Responsive | $137,500.00 $ 115,499.00 $ 149,664.00 $ 101,888.00 $ 165548.00
2019 Thinning 80 $0.00 $0.00 80 $274.00 | $21,92000 | 80 |$ 88.00|$ 7,04000| 80 |$ 98.00|$  7,84000| 80 | $155.00|$ 12,400.00 | 80 $0.00 $0.00 80 |$ 9800|$ 7,840.00| 80 |$158.00|$ 12,64000| 80 |$190.00| $ 1520000 | 80 | $260.00 | $  20,800.00

Payette Lakes iShi
For p“;‘:)o;s?b‘l’é f;’ig'z':(‘)’i‘scz?es for | cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $118.00 [ $118.00 1 $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 1 $ 88.00 | $ 88.00 1 $ 77.00 | $ 77.00 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 78.00|$ 78.00 1 $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 1 $208.00 | $ 208.00 1 $ 89.00 | $ 89.00
Payette Lakes Totals $0.00 $22,038.00 $ 7,118.00 $  7,928.00 $ 12,477.00 $0.00 $ 7,918.00 $  12,718.00 $  15408.00 $  20,889.00
2019 Thinning 500 $0.00 $0.00 500 $274.00| $137,000.00] 500 |$ 88.00 | $ 44,000.00 | 500 |$ 98.00 |$  49,000.00 | 500 |$102.00|$ 51,000.00 | 500 $0.00 $0.00 500 |$ 80.00|$ 40,00000| 500 |$ 98.00|% 4900000 | 500 |$126.00|$ 6300000 | 500 |$220.00|$ 110,000.00

SW Idaho ishi
For p”;’f)?;bfef f;‘i‘z‘z:‘é?gc:‘es for | cull Removal 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $146.00 |  $146.00 1 $ 78.00 | $ 78.00 1 $ 88.00 | $ 88.00 1 $ - $ - 1 $0.00 $0.00 1 $ 78.00|$ 78.00 1 $0.00 |$ - 1 $208.00 | $ 208.00 1 $125.00 | $ 125.00
Southwest Totals $0.00 $137,146.00 $ 44,078.00 $  49,088.00 $ 51,000.00 $0.00 $ 40,078.00 |  NonResponsve | $  49,000.00 $  63,208.00 $ 110,125.00




	Bid Summary
	2017
	2018
	2019
	2017.pdf
	2017


