RFQ NO. 18-207-2 EVALUATION SHEET
FOREST ROADSIDE SPRAY

RGZ Forestry LLC Saddlehorn LLC DeAngelo Brothers LLC Woodland Resource Services Inc. QSA, LLC Triple B Excavation LLC
Medford OR 97501 Council ID 83612 Portland OR 97230 Ellensburg WA 98926 Spirit Lake ID 83869 Potlatch ID 83855
ESTIMATED | i1 oF | FixeD UNIT
SUPERVISORY AREA | PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER | TREATMENTTYPE | UNIT(S) OF | o0 o Lo o TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT FIXED UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT FIXED UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT FIXED UNIT PRICE TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT FIXED UNIT PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT|  FIXED UNIT PRICE | TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
MEASURE su
Priest Lake | o R‘E"::f 25;’;"’;82018 | Truck Access | 150 | Miles | $ 1,300.00 $195,000.00 no bid no bid $ 162.00 $24,300.00 $ 186.00 $27,900.00 no bid no bid $ 175.00 $26,250.00
Priest Lake Total: $195,000.00 Priest Lake Total: no bid Priest Lake Total: $24,300.00 Priest Lake Total: $27,900.00 Priest Lake Total: no bid Priest Lake Total: $26,250.00
Pend Oreille Lake | P0L2103 ;::"zsz'gelzp’a" | Truck Access | 75 | Miles | $ 1,300.00 $97,500.00 no bid no bid $ 68.00 $5,100.00 $ 92.50 $6,937.50 $ 67.00 $5,025.00 no bid no bid
Pend Oreille Lake Total: $97,500.00 Pend Oreille Lake Total: no bid Pend Oreille Lake Total: $5,100.00 Pend Oreille Lake Total:| $6,937.50 Pend Oreille Lake Total:| $5,025.00 Pend Oreille Lake Total:| no bid
Mica Mica Roadside Spray 2018 | Truck Access | 869 | Miles | S 1,300.00 $112,970.00 no bid no bid $ 68.00 $5,909.20 no bid no bid S 67.00 $5,822.30 S 73.00 $6,343.70
22-170-228-18 | OHV/ATV Access | 10 | Miles [ S 1,500.00 $15,000.00 no bid no bid 3 179.00 $1,790.00 no bid no bid 3 67.00 $670.00 3 80.00 $800.00
Mica Total: $127,970.00 Mica Total no bid Mica Total $7,699.20 Mica Total no bid Mica Total $6,492.30 Mica Total $7,143.70
Maggie Creek | We:’;zs"s":‘z’;"’leg il | Truck Access | 203 | Miles | $ 1530000 $26,390.00 no bid no bid $ 68.00 $1,380.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Maggie Creek Total: $26,390.00 Maggie Creek Total no bid Maggie Creek Total $1,380.40 Maggie Creek Total no bid Maggie Creek Total no bid Maggie Creek Total no bid
Payette Lakes | R°ad5'd:0’\‘:’;"6°;;:/1e;d Spray Truck Access | 76.6 | Miles | $ 1,300.00 $99,580.00 $ 112,50 $8,617.50 $ 68.00 $5,208.80 $ 108.00 $8,272.80 no bid no bid no bid no bid
Payette Lakes Total: $99,580.00 Payette Lakes Total $8,617.50 Payette Lakes Total $5,208.80 Payette Lakes Total $8,272.80 Payette Lakes Total no bid Payette Lakes Total no bid
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