
TREATMENT NUMBER UNIT PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER PRICE PER
TYPE OF UNITS TYPE UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT UNIT

$272.00 NO BID $210.00 $263.00 $189.00 $184.00 $209.00 $318.00 $209.00 $218.00 NO BID

$60.00 NO BID $95.00 $117.00 $78.00 $74.00 $80.00 $139.00 $78.00 $98.00 NO BID

$130.00 NO BID $170.00 $269.40 $149.00 $159.00 $119.00 $241.00 $121.00 $168.00 NO BID

$275.00 $297.00 $310.00 NO BID $220.00 $229.00 $307.00 $517.00 $298.00 $290.00 $260.00

$170.00 $220.00 $310.00 $319.00 $230.00 $239.00 $229.00 $371.00 $234.00 $318.00 $215.00

$165.00 $285.00 $280.00 $369.00 $280.00 $289.00 $340.00 $557.00 $328.00 $278.00 $195.00

$151.00 $190.00 $175.00 $278.00 $189.00 $184.00 $192.00 $313.00 $185.00 $178.00 $185.00

* *
$164.00 $165.00 $118.00 $147.99 $149.00 $156.00 $115.00 $223.00 $115.00 $128.00 $165.00

$104.00 $150.00 $118.00 $296.94 $110.00 $99.00 $91.00 $223.00 $92.00 $120.00 $190.00

AWARD 578 AWARD 0 AWARD 454 AWARD 0 AWARD 418 AWARD 336 AWARD 653 AWARD 0 AWARD 0 AWARD 0 AWARD 0

Maggie Creek Peterson Corners Pruning

EachFM # 42-253-109-18
 10,296.00$            14,850.00$            11,682.00$            29,397.06$            10,890.00$              9,801.00$  

Pruning 99

Maggie Creek  What A Butte PCT

EachFM # 42-249-112-18
 61,336.00$            61,710.00$            44,132.00$            55,348.26$            55,726.00$              58,344.00$              

Thinning 374

Ponderosa 2018 Ponderosa Area PCT

EachFM # 41-287-112-18
 68,554.00$            86,260.00$            79,450.00$            126,212.00$          85,806.00$              83,536.00$              

Thinning 454 not awarded due to acre limitation

St Joe 2018 Town PCT

EachFM # 30-794-112-18
 47,190.00$            81,510.00$            80,080.00$            105,534.00$          80,080.00$              82,654.00$              

Thinning 286

5 Star Forestry
Kooskia ID

LG Forestry Inc
Central Point OR

Alpha Services LLC
Cda ID

PL Thinning 2018
Each

Priest Lake Thinning 336
FM # 10-638-112-18
 61,824.00$              63,504.00$              88,368.00$            70,560.00$            NO BID91,392.00$            
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SUPERVISORY PROJECT NAME 
AREA

PRECOMMERCIAL THINNING & SLASHING     

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT AND NUMBER

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

Tovar's Reforestation LLC 
Medford OR  97501

JOI Forest Inc.
Medford OR

Gonzalez Forestry Inc.
Central Point OR

FM # 10-642-108-18
 3,000.00$              NO BID 4,750.00$              5,850.00$              3,900.00$  3,700.00$  
Betwixt Slashing


Each
Priest Lake Slashing 50

FM # 20-921-112-18
 23,400.00$            NO BID 30,600.00$            48,492.00$            26,820.00$              28,620.00$              
POL 2018 PCT 


Each
Pend Oreille Thinning 180

FM # 22-167-112-18
 114,950.00$          124,146.00$          129,580.00$          NO BID 91,960.00$              95,722.00$              
Mica PCT 2018


Each
Mica Thinning 418

FM # 30-793-112-18
 41,140.00$            53,240.00$            75,020.00$            77,198.00$            55,660.00$              57,838.00$              
2018 Floodwood PCT


Each
St Joe Thinning 242

NTE Acres:  1,000NTE Acres:  700 NTE Acres:  1,500 NTE Acres:  No Limit NTE Acres:  NO LIMIT NTE Acres:  NO LIMIT

OC Forestry Inc.
Medford OR

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

70,224.00$              

4,000.00$                

21,420.00$              

128,326.00$            

55,418.00$              

97,240.00$              

87,168.00$              

43,010.00$              

9,009.00$                

NTE Acres:  2,500

Summitt Forests, Inc.
Ashland OR

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

106,848.00$            

6,950.00$                

43,380.00$              

216,106.00$            

89,782.00$              

159,302.00$            

142,102.00$            

83,402.00$              

22,077.00$              

NTE Acres:  NO LIMIT

Earth Industries LLC
Central Point OR

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

70,224.00$              

3,900.00$  

21,780.00$              

124,564.00$            

56,628.00$              

93,808.00$              

83,990.00$              

30,240.00$              

121,220.00$            

76,956.00$              

79,508.00$              

80,812.00$              

Sprout Forestry Inc.
Central Point OR

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

73,248.00$              

4,900.00$  

83,990.00$              

61,710.00$              43,010.00$              

9,108.00$  

NTE Acres:  2,500

* Tie bid determined by coin toss 
witnessed by Sherry Groeschl, Senior 
Buyer.  Heads was OC Forestry and 
Tails was Earth Industries.  Sherry 
Groeschl flipped a quarter and the coin 
landed Heads up.

18,810.00$              

NTE Acres:  NO LIMIT

47,872.00$              

11,880.00$              

NTE Acres:  1,000

Lara Brothers LTD
Castle Rock WA

TOTAL EXTENDED
AMOUNT

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

108,680.00$            

52,030.00$              

55,770.00$              
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