
UNITS OF 
MEASURE #

UNIT OF 
MEASURE

 L PROVIDE CHEMICAL

281 Acres

123 Acres

108 Acres

 WILL PROVIDE CHEMICAL

496 Acres

48 Acres

95 Acres

194 Acres

30 Acres

447 Acres

72 Acres

337 Acres

IDL ITB 19-213                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                             
GROUND BASED HERBICIDE APPLICATION

Mica

St. Joe

* State will 
provide 

Clopyralid Only

Ponderosa

Maggie Creek

Payette Lakes
PAY 2018 Ground Herbicid

378 Directed Broadcast Acres 87.02$                 32,893.56$             
50-472-104-18

32,893.56$             

Fake News Broadcast 
Herbicide 508 Waving Wand Acres 78.74$                 39,999.92$             

42-254-104-18
39,999.92$             

41-292-107-18 Directed Broadcast 
Units 4 - 6 75.79$                 25,541.23$             

63,355.57$             

2018 Ponderosa Ground 
Based Herbicide 

Application

Waving Wand            
Units 1 - 3 & 7 - 10 73.82$                 32,997.54$             

Waving Wand            
Unit 11 (Alternate) 66.90$                 4,816.80$               

40-1268-104-18 Roadside Broadcast 
Unit 9 120.01$               3,600.30$               

26,185.73$             

Clearwater
CLW Ground Based 

Herbicide 

*Waving Wand      Unit 
1 47.07$                 4,471.65$               

Directed Broadcast 
Units 2- 8 93.37$                 18,113.78$             

30-796-104-19 Spot Application        
Unit 1 64.41$                 3,091.68$               

47,300.16$             

018 St Joe G Herbicide Spr Waving Wand           
Units 2 - 10 89.13$                 44,208.48$             

22-166-104-18
Hack & Squirt/ Waving 
Wand            Units 9 - 

12
136.64$               14,757.12$             

46,677.16$             

2018 Mica Backpack 
Spraying/Hack & Squirt 

Waving Wand            
Units 1 - 6 79.01$                 22,201.81$             

Waving Wand                 
Units 7 - 8 79.01$                 9,718.23$               

SUPERVISORY 
AREA 

PROJECT NAME AND
 FM PROJECT # TREATMENT TYPE PRICE / UNIT OF 

MEASURE
TOTAL EXTENDED 

AMOUNT
PRICE / UNIT OF 

MEASURE
TOTAL EXTENDED 

AMOUNT

138.00$                    38,778.00$               

138.00$                    16,974.00$               

414.00$                    44,712.00$               

100,464.00$             

159.00$                    78,864.00$               

246.00$                    11,808.00$               

90,672.00$               

141.00$                    13,395.00$               

313.00$                    60,722.00$               

313.00$                    9,390.00$                 

83,507.00$               

166.00$                    74,202.00$               

156.00$                    11,232.00$               

319.00$                    107,503.00$             

192,937.00$             

178.00$                    90,424.00$               

90,424.00$               

304.00$                    114,912.00$             

114,912.00$             

PRICE / UNIT OF 
MEASURE

TOTAL EXTENDED 
AMOUNT

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

-$                         

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

-$                         

NO BID NO BID

NO BID

65,024.00$               

128.00$                    48,384.00$               

48,384.00$               

PRICE / UNIT OF 
MEASURE

TOTAL EXTENDED 
AMOUNT

198.00$                    55,638.00$               

210.00$                    25,830.00$               

298.00$                    32,184.00$               

113,652.00$             

198.00$                    98,208.00$               

210.00$                    10,080.00$               

108,288.00$             

210.00$                    19,950.00$               

210.00$                    NO BID

NO BID NO BID

66,990.00$               

195.00$                    87,165.00$               

210.00$                    15,120.00$               

198.00$                    66,726.00$               

-$                         

128.00$                    65,024.00$               

-$                         

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID

169,011.00$             

195.00$                    99,060.00$               

99,060.00$               

198.00$                    74,844.00$               

74,844.00$               

ALPHA SERVICES                         
COEUR D'ALENE, ID

SUMMITT FORESTS, INC                                                                
ASHLAND, OR

5-STAR FORESTRY, LLC                                     
KOOSKIA, ID

RGZ FORESTRY, LLC                          
MEDFORD, OR

Mica Total:

St. Joe Total:

Clearwater Total:

Ponderosa Total:

Maggie Creek Total:

Payette Lakes Total:

40,740.00$               

210.00$                    6,300.00$                 
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