
MINIMUM DAILY TOOL

PRODUCTION REQUIRED

Trees 15,000 Any 80,388.00$               NO BID 66,951.72$           151,588.80$         74,378.04$           

Acres n/a Directed Spray 33,405.00$               NO BID 38,907.00$           95,892.00$           35,763.00$           

113,793.00$             NO BID 105,858.72$         247,480.80$         110,141.04$         

Trees (units 1, 5, 6) Shovel 11,005.00$               8,165.00$             8,165.00$             15,336.00$           6,730.80$             
Trees (other units) Shovel 24,149.00$               17,917.00$           17,917.00$           33,652.80$           14,769.84$           

Tubes 7,500 16,350.00$               3,052.00$             5,450.00$             17,200.20$           8,153.20$             
51,504.00$               29,134.00$           31,532.00$           66,189.00$           29,653.84$           

ITEM MINIMUM DAILY TOOL

TYPE PRODUCTION REQUIRED

12,383.49$           

0.4370$             13,066.30$           

0.3640$             19,692.40$           

ALPHA SERVICES

FIXED UNIT 

PRICE 

0.1840$             8,169.60$             

0.1670$             3,941.20$             

0.1943$             

91.0000$          

0.1896$             
0.1896$             
0.3740$             

0.1739$             70,968.59$           

PRICE / TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTITEM

0.2170$             6,488.30$             

0.2289$             

SPRING PLANTING 2019

SCHEDULE  A
ITB NO. 19-203 PROGRESSIVE FORESTRY 

SERVICES
TOVAR'S 

REFORESTATION FAITH FORESTRY SUMMITT FORESTS

FIXED UNIT TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTPRICE 

0.3960$             17,582.40$           

0.3500$             10,465.00$           

0.3500$             18,935.00$           

PRICE / TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTITEM

PRICE / TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTITEM

0.2600$             

TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNT

0.4940$             11,658.40$           

0.3960$             

244.0000$        

0.4320$             
0.4320$             
0.7890$             

0.3960$             161,607.60$         

7,774.00$             

0.2500$             13,525.00$           

FIXED UNIT TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTPRICE 

0.1749$             7,765.56$             

0.1749$             4,127.64$             

0.1749$             

99.0000$          

0.2300$             
0.2300$             
0.2500$             

0.1749$             71,376.69$           

PRICE / TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTITEM

ST. JOE TOTAL

CLEARWATER TOTAL

FALL PLANTING 2019

FIXED UNIT TOTAL 
EXTENDED 

AMOUNTPRICE 

0.2400$             10,656.00$           

0.2600$             6,136.00$             

NO BID

NO BID

0.2300$             
0.2300$             
0.1400$             

0.2300$             93,863.00$           

44,400 15,000 Hoedad 7,992.00$                 
10-641-102-19

30-790-102-19

21,800

73,458.00$               

TOTAL EXTENDED 
AMOUNT

30-820-102-19

PROJECT NAME QUANTITY PRICE /

 AND NUMBER

2019 St Joe Fall Plant 

Priest Lake
Priest Lake Fall Plant 2019

Trees 29,900 15,000 Hoedad 0.3100$                     9,269.00$                 
10-657-102-19

Trees 408,100 25,000 Hoedad 0.1800$                     

Priest Lake Spring Plant 2019
Trees

Trees Hoedad 0.1800$                     4,248.00$                 
20-920-102-19

Pend Orielle
POL 2019 Spring Plant

23,600 10,000

0.1800$                     

St. Joe

382,800 0.2100$                     

85.0000$                   

2019 St. Joe Spring Planting & 
Spray-Contractor provides 

Chemicals

Priest Lake

393

CLW Plant & Tube 2019-
Provided by the IDL

OF ITEMS

54,100

SUPERVISORY PROJECT NAME 

AREA

FIXED UNIT 

PRICE  AND NUMBER

ESTIMATED NUMBER 
OF UNITS

UNIT OF MEASURE 
DESCRIPTION TOTAL EXTENDED 

AMOUNT

15,000

41-286-102-19

40-1263-102-19

Ponderosa

35,500
77,900

0.3100$                     

Ponderosa Planting 2019

0.3100$                     

Trees

SUPERVISORY

AREA

St. Joe

ITEM

Any 21,099.00$               0.3900$                     

7500 (unit 1, 5, 6) 
15,000 (other)

Clearwater
0.7500$                     
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