CONTRACT NO. 19-207-1
2019 FOREST ROADSIDE SPRAY

QSA, LLC

D'Angelo Brothers

Woodland Resource

Cutting Edge
Forestry, Inc

SUPERVISORY AREA PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER .. Portland, OR Svs
Spirit Lake, Idaho Talent, OR
Ellensburg, WA
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riest Lake Roadside Spray 2013 No bid $28,968.66 $31,996.50 $203,184.00
10-662-228-19

Pend Oreille Lake POL 19 Roadside Spray $8.228.00 $8,061.02 No bid $120,758.00
20-944-228-19
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Mica ica Roadside Spray 2013 $5,250.00 $4,982.25 No bid $74,850.00
22-180-228-19

St. Joe 2019 St. Joe Roadside Spray No Bid $7.930.00 No bid $124,750.00
30-825-228-19

Maggie Creek Woodrat Roadsidekill No bid $3.851.05 No bid $34.930.00

42-263-228-19
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