BID EVALUATION

SAWTOOTH SERVICES

FAMILY LEGACY ENT

ALPHA SERVICES

LARA BROS

CONTRACT NO. 19-217 Nampa, ID Fernwood, ID Coeur d'Alene, ID Castle Rock, WA
CONE COLLECTION
SUPERVISORY AREA PROJECT NAME AND ACTION 5ET—SSUOR'I:E UNIT OF | $/UNIT OF | TOTAL EXTENDED| $/UNIT OF | TOTAL EXTENDED| $/ UNIT OF | TOTAL EXTENDED| $/UNIT OF | TOTAL EXTENDED
NUMBER EST. # MEASURE | MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT
Priest Lake PL Cone Collection 18 Douglas-fir Cone Picking 30 Bushel $80.00 $ 2,400.00 $ - $68.00 $ 2,040.00 $ -
10-655-106-18 Ponderosa Cone Picking 25 Bushel $110.00 $ 2,750.00 $ - $42.00 $ 1,050.00 $ -
Western Larch Cone Picking 10 Bushel $210.00 $ 2,100.00 $ - $123.00 $ 1,230.00 $ -
Lodgepole Cone Picking 15 Bushel $180.00 $ 2,700.00 $ - $104.00 $ 1,560.00 $ -
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 20 Bushel $180.00 $ 3,600.00 $ - $104.00 $ 2,080.00 $ -
TOTAL| $ 13,550.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 7,960.00 TOTAL No Bid
i Douglas-fir Cone Pickin
FM Bureau Paradise Valley Seed Orchard ) 30 Bushel | $22000 |$ 6,600.00 $ - | sssso0 |s 11,640.00 $ -
00-048-303-13
TOTAL| $ 6,600.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 11,640.00 TOTAL $ -
Pend Oreille POL Cone Collection 2016 |Douglas-fir Cone Picking 30 Bushel $95.00 $ 2,850.00 $ - $67.00 $ 2,010.00 $ -
20-904-106-16 Ponderosa Cone Picking 75 Bushel $95.00 $ 7,125.00 $ - $38.48 $ 2,886.00 $ -
Western Larch Cone Picking 10 Bushel $210.00 $ 2,100.00 $ - $118.00 $ 1,180.00 $ -
Lodgepole Cone Picking 10 Bushel $150.00 $ 1,500.00 $ - $97.00 $ 970.00 $ -
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 20 Bushel $170.00 $ 3,400.00 $ - $97.00 $ 1,940.00 $ -
TOTAL| $ 16,975.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 8,986.00 TOTAL $ -
St. Joe St. Joe Forever Cone Douglas-fir Cone Picking 60 Bushel $95.00 $ 5,700.00 $65.00 $ 3,900.00 $67.00 $ 4,020.00 $85.00 $ 5,100.00
Collection Ponderosa Cone Picking 75 Bushel $95.00 $ 7,125.00 $32.00 $ 2,400.00 $38.00 $ 2,850.00 $45.00 $ 3,375.00
30-815-106-19 Western Larch Cone Picking 10 Bushel $210.00 | $ 2,100.00 | $115.00 | $ 1,150.00 | $117.00 | $ 1,170.00 | $135.00 | $ 1,350.00
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 20 Bushel $170.00 $ 3,400.00 $85.00 $ 1,700.00 $97.00 $ 1,940.00 $190.00 $ 3,800.00
TOTAL| $ 18,325.00 TOTAL $ 9,150.00 TOTAL $ 9,980.00 TOTAL $ 13,625.00
Ponderosa Ponderosa Cone Collection Douglas-fir Cone Picking 50 Bushel $120.00 $ 6,000.00 $65.00 $ 3,250.00 $64.37 $ 3,218.50 $85.00 $ 4,250.00
41-060-106-06 Ponderosa Cone Picking 75 Bushel $22.00 $ 1,650.00 $32.00 $ 2,400.00 $36.99 $ 2,774.25 $45.00 $ 3,375.00
Western Larch Cone Picking 12 Bushel $138.00 $ 1,656.00 $115.00 $ 1,380.00 $117.00 $ 1,404.00 $135.00 $ 1,620.00
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 12 Bushel $148.00 $ 1,776.00 $85.00 $ 1,020.00 $97.00 $ 1,164.00 $190.00 $ 2,280.00
TOTAL| $ 11,082.00 TOTAL $ 8,050.00 TOTAL $ 8,560.75 TOTAL $ 11,525.00
Clearwater Clearwater Cone Collection Douglas-fir Cone Picking 75 Bushel $65.00 $ 4,875.00 $ - $64.38 $ 4,828.50 $85.00 $ 6,375.00
40-1279-106-18 Ponderosa Cone Picking 75 Bushel $105.00 $ 7,875.00 $ - $36.99 $ 2,774.25 $45.00 $ 3,375.00
Western Larch Cone Picking 20 Bushel $220.00 $ 4,400.00 $ - $117.00 $ 2,340.00 $135.00 $ 2,700.00
Lodgepole Cone Picking 10 Bushel $190.00 $ 1,900.00 $ - $97.00 $ 970.00 $95.00 $ 950.00
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 25 Bushel $190.00 $ 4,750.00 $ - $97.00 $ 2,425.00 $190.00 $ 4,750.00
TOTAL| $ 23,800.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 13,337.75 TOTAL $ 18,150.00
Maggie Creek MC Area Cones Douglas-fir Cone Picking 75 Bushel $85.00 $ 6,375.00 $ - $64.38 $ 4,828.50 $85.00 $ 6,375.00
42-102-106-08 Ponderosa Cone Picking 100 Bushel $105.00 $ 10,500.00 $ - $36.99 $ 3,699.00 $45.00 $ 4,500.00
Western Larch Cone Picking 25 Bushel $220.00 $ 5,500.00 $ - $117.00 $ 2,925.00 $135.00 $ 3,375.00
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 10 Bushel $190.00 $ 1,900.00 $ - $97.00 $ 970.00 $190.00 $ 1,900.00
TOTAL| $ 24,275.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 12,422.50 TOTAL $ 16,150.00
Payette Lakes 2018 Cone Collection Douglas-fir Cone Picking 50 Bushel $35.00 $ 1,750.00 $ - $74.00 $ 3,700.00 $ -
50-480-106-18 Ponderosa Cone Picking 75 Bushel $23.00 $ 1,725.00 $ - $40.00 $ 3,000.00 $ -
Western Larch Cone Picking 12 Bushel $92.00 $ 1,104.00 $ - $123.00 $ 1,476.00 $ -
Lodgepole Cone Picking 15 Bushel $37.00 $ 555.00 $ - $108.00 $ 1,620.00 $ -
Engelman Spruce Cone Picking 20 Bushel $43.00 $ 860.00 $ - $108.00 $ 2,160.00 $ -
TOTAL| $ 5,994.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 11,956.00 TOTAL No Bid
Southwest Southwest Cone Collection Douglas-fir Cone Picking 50 Bushel $28.00 $ 1,400.00 $ - $77.00 $ 3,850.00 $ -
60-295-106-08 Ponderosa Cone Picking 65 Bushel $20.00 $ 1,300.00 $ - $44.40 $ 2,886.00 $ -
Lodgepole Cone Picking 7 Bushel $37.00 $ 259.00 $ - $108.00 $ 756.00 $ -
TOTAL| $ 2,959.00 TOTAL No Bid TOTAL $ 7,492.00 TOTAL No Bid
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