ITB 19-418 Juniper Ti

Project

Summitt Forestry
Ashland, Oregon

Thomas Cattle Company
Oreana, Idaho

Gonzalez Forestry
Central Point, Oregon

Mountain View Reforestation
Central Point, Oregon

Imperial Forestry
Central Point, Oregon

Rye Tree Service
Florence, Oregon

Sawtooth Services, LLC
Nampa, Idaho

PROJECT NAME NUMBER | UNIT |PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED| PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER | TOTAL EXTENDED | PRICE PER |TOTAL EXTENDED| PRICE PER TOTAL EXTENDED
AND NUMBER OF UNITS| TYPE UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT UNIT AMOUNT

Alder Creek 640 $65.64 $140.00 $78.00 $56.00 $75.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID

RAALDR-PS Each $42,009.60 $89,600.00 $ 49,920.00 $ 35,840.00 $ 48,000.00 $ 96,000.00 $ -

Slaughterhouse Guich 164 $151.34 NO BID NO BID $148.00 $80.00 $145.00 $350.00 $199.00

RAALDR-PS Each $ 24,819.76 $ - $ 24,272.00 $ 13,120.00 $ 23,780.00 $ 57,400.00 $ 32,636.00

Phase 4 Triangle 1051 $83.74 NO BID NO BID $78.00 $54.00 $75.00 $150.00 NO BID NO BID

RATRIA-PS Each $ 88,010.74 - $ 81,978.00 $ 56,754.00 $ 78,825.00 $157,650.00




