BID EVALUATION
CONTRACT NO. 20-213

PROGRESSIVE FORESTRY

ALPHA SERVICES

RGZ FORESTRY

CUTTING EDGE FORESTRY

HERBICIDE APPLICATION SANDPOINT, ID COEUR D'ALENE, ID MEDFORD, OR TALENT, OR
TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL TOTAL
SUPERVISORY PROJECT NAME AND UNITS OF UNIT OF PRICE / UNIT OF PRICE / UNIT OF PRICE / UNIT OF PRICE / UNIT OF
TREATMENT TYPE EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED EXTENDED
AREA FM PROJECT # MEASURE # MEASURE MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT MEASURE AMOUNT
STATE WILL PROVIDE CHEMICAL
Mica Mica Ground Based Spray
2019 399 Waving Wand Acres $ 62.00 24,738.00 | $ 72.82|$ 2905518 $ 129.00 [ $ 51,471.00]| $ 89.00 | $ 35,511.00
22-181-104-19
Mica Total: 24,738.00 Mica Total: $ 29,055.18 Mica Total: $ 51,471.00 Mica Total: $ 35,511.00
CONTRACTOR WILL PROVIDE CHEMICAL
Priest Lake PL Ground Herbicide FY20
96 Waving Wand Acres $ 94.00 9,024.00 | $ 8952 [ $ 8,593.92 | $ 235.00 | $ 22,560.00 | $ 143.00 | $ 13,728.00
10-659-104-18
Priest Lake Total: 9,024.00 | Priest Lake Total: [ $ 8,593.92 |Priest Lake Total:] $ 22,560.00 | Priest Lake Total:| $ 13,728.00
Pend Oreille Lake POL 19 Waving Wand
358 Waving Wand Acres $ 78.00 27,924.00 | $ 8741 ($ 3129278 | $ 189.00 | $ 67,662.00 | $ 114.00 | $ 40,812.00
20-945-104-19
POL Total: 27,924.00 POL Total: 31,292.78 POL Total: $ 67,662.00 POL Total: $ 40,812.00
St. Joe 2019 St Joe Ground Herbicide | ) Waving Wand Acres | $ - - |s 120.18 30,165.18 | $ 198.00 | $ 49,698.00 | $ 129.00 | $ 32,379.00
Spray unit(s) 1, 4-7
30-824-104-19 68 Sh'ﬂii?s)sgog gpray Acres | $ - - s 9081 |$ 617508 $ 235.00 | $ 15,980.00 | $ 197.00 | $ 13,396.00
St. Joe Total: NO BID St. Joe Total: $ 36,340.26 St. Joe Total: $ 65,678.00 St. Joe Total: $ 45,775.00
Clearwater CLW Ground Based
Spray2019
* State will provide 268 Waving Wand Acres $ = - $ 8312 $ 22276.16 | $ 189.00 | $ 50,652.00 | $ 107.39 | $ 28,780.52
chemical for units 3 40-1290-104-19
&6
Clearwater Total: NO BID Clearwater Total: | $ 22,276.16 |Clearwater Total:| $ 50,652.00 | Clearwater Total: | $ 28,780.52
Waving Wand
Ponderosa 2019 Ponderosa Ground 603 Unit(s) 1-7, 14,15, | Acres | $ 79.00 47,637.00 | $ 7835 | $  47,245.05 | $ 120.00 | $ 77,787.00| $ 101.00 | $ 60,903.00
Based Herbicide Application 17-19
Directed Spray
41-305-107-19 599 Unit(s) 8 - 13, 16, Acres $ 79.00 47,321.00 | $ 91.36 | $ 54,72464| $ 129.00 | $ 77,271.00| $ 176.00 | $ 105,424.00
20-23
Ponderosa Total: 94,958.00 | Ponderosa Total: | $ 101,969.69 |Ponderosa Total:| $ 155,058.00 | Ponderosa Total: | $ 166,327.00
Maggie Creek MC Herbicide Site Pre i i
= F nepy|[ESE a\r,‘\‘,ﬂ‘"dwa‘""g Acres |$ : - |s 13026 | $ 251,011.02 | $ 129.00 | $ 248,583.00 | 14100 | $  271,707.00
42-260-104-19 an
Maggie Creek Total NO BID aggie Creek Total] $ 251,011.02 flaggie Creek Tota| $ 248,583.00 Maggie Creek Totall $ 271,707.00
Southwest Turkey Track 2019 Herbicide .
53 Waving Wand Acres $ o - $ 20641 [ $ 10,939.73 | $ 235.00 | $ 12,455.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 6,360.00
60-357-104-18
Southwest Total: NO BID Southwest Total: | $ 10,939.73 | Southwest Total:[ $ 12,455.00 | Southwest Total: | $ 6,360.00

Please be advised that all bids for the Maggie Creek Herbicide Project have come in over-budget and

this portion of the project has been cancelled.
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