
                              
 
 
 
                              Job Descriptions – Fire Management Seasonal Positions 
 
 
Firefighter II – Class Code #91807 
Perform and assist in wildland fire suppression operations and hazard management projects.  Operate and 
maintain firefighting equipment, construct fireline, and assist with ignition operations.  May be assigned to carry 
out specialized assignments such as tree falling, backfire, and burnout operations; utilizes a variety of 
specialized tools, equipment and techniques while actively managing wildfires. May assist in preparation of 
timber sales and forest management projects by using some knowledge of forest measurement technology, 
dendrology, pathology and entomology. May perform other duties as assigned. May be required to operate 
light vehicles, chain saws, portable pumps and ATV/UTVs. A valid driver's license may be required for some 
jobs. 
 
Minimum Qualifications: No previous wildland fire suppression experience required.  Must be able to read, 
write, and communicate effectively.  Perform strenuous work for extended periods of time.  Must be able to 
learn how to use a radio, use resource management equipment, and read maps. Must be capable of 
successfully completing training to qualify as a National Interagency Incident Management System (NIIMS) 
FFT2. Must be able to perform strenuous and arduous work outside for up to 16 hours per day.  Must be willing 
to work in isolated locations for 14 - 21 days at a time (required in some locations).  Must be 18 years of age or 
older. 
 
Firefighter II Physical Requirements:  The duties of these positions require that the incumbent meet prescribed 
physical requirements as measured by the Work Capacity Fitness Test at the arduous level.  To meet the 
arduous level the incumbent must be able to walk 3 miles within 45 minutes while carrying 45 pounds.  Failure 
to meet the required physical qualifications will disqualify you for employment. 
 
Firefighter I - Class Code #91806 
Perform and assist in wildland fire suppression operations and hazard management projects.  Operate and 
maintain firefighting equipment, construct fireline, and assist with ignition operations.  May be assigned to carry 
out specialized assignments such as tree falling, backfire, and burnout operations; utilizes a variety of 
specialized tools, equipment and techniques while actively managing wildfires. May assist in preparation of 
timber sales and forest management projects by using some knowledge of forest measurement technology, 
dendrology, pathology and entomology. May perform other duties as assigned. May be required to operate 
light vehicles, chain saws, portable pumps and ATV/UTVs. May supervise up to five Firefighter II’s and 
assist with training. A valid driver's license may be required for some jobs.   
 
Minimum Qualifications: Have a minimum of two seasons as a Firefighter 2 or equivalent experience AND 
National Interagency Incident Management System (NIIMS) qualified as a FFTI and/or ICT5. Perform 
strenuous work for extended periods of time.  Must be able to use a radio, use resource management 
equipment, and read maps. Some knowledge of computer processing and use, GIS/GPS interface, and data 
recording.  Must be able to perform strenuous and arduous work outside for up to 16 hours per day.  Must be 
willing to work in isolated locations for 14 - 21 days at a time (required in some locations).  Must be 18 years of 
age or older. 
 
Firefighter I Physical Requirements: The duties of these positions require that the incumbent meet prescribed 
physical requirements as measured by the Work Capacity Fitness Test at the arduous level.  To meet the 
arduous level the incumbent must be able to walk 3 miles within 45 minutes while carrying 45 pounds. Failure 
to meet the required physical qualifications will disqualify you for employment. 
 
  



Resource Boss– Class Code #91814 
Will supervise and train Firefighter I and Firefighter II personnel in preparation for wildland fire suppression/pre-
suppression, timber management, and hazard management projects.  Coordinate activities, monitor, and 
evaluate the performance of Firefighters. Maintain accurate documentation and records while performing the 
supervisory role. Assists in all aspects of wildland and prescribed fire operations including preparation, ignition, 
monitoring, holding, mop-up and rehabilitation. Along with supervision could assist in training of personnel in all 
fire skills including engine operation.  Those with ICT4 Red Card Qualifications may act in the capacity of the 
Incident Commander for Type 4 fires. May perform other duties as assigned. A valid driver's license may be 
required for some jobs. 
 
Specialty Area:  Helicopter Manager/Helitack Foreman – Responsible for crew (up to 10 crewmembers), 
helicopter contractual oversight, equipment and crew reporting, schedule of resources.  Conduct helicopter 
inspections, pilot briefings, complete payment documents and provide helicopter contract administration 
assistance.   
 
Specialty Area:  Crew Foreman – Leads District Fire Crews, performs administrative duties, maintains fire 
equipment and provides input for reports.  Coordinate activities, monitor, and evaluate the performance of 
Firefighters. Serves as a Prescribed Fire Monitor, collecting and evaluation weather, fuels, topography and fire 
behavior data for prescribed and wildland fires. Serves as Ignition Specialist, Field Observer, Squad Boss or as 
a holding or ignition crew member. 
 
Minimum Qualifications:  Must have a minimum of two (2) seasons previous experience in a resource related 
field OR one season previous experience and 2 years of college education in a resource related field OR 
equivalent experience AND National Interagency Incident Management System (NIIMS) qualified in one or 
more Single Resource Boss positions and/or ICT4 or greater. Perform strenuous work for extended periods of 
time.  Must be able to use a radio, use resource management equipment, and read maps. Some knowledge of 
computer processing and use, GIS/GPS interface, and data recording.  Must be able to perform strenuous 
and arduous work outside for up to 16 hours per day.  Must be willing to work in isolated locations for 14 - 21 
days at a time (required in some locations).  Must be 18 years of age or older. 
 
Resource Boss Physical Requirements: The duties of these positions require that the incumbent meet 
prescribed physical requirements as measured by the Work Capacity Fitness Test at the arduous level.  To 
meet the arduous level the incumbent must be able to walk 3 miles within 45 minutes while carrying 45 
pounds. Failure to meet the required physical qualifications will disqualify you for employment. 
 
Dispatcher– Class Code #91810 
Provide coordinated dispatch and tracking of resources in support of fire preparedness, fire suppression and 
prescribed fire activities. Coordinate the availability and use of personnel and equipment between incident 
commanders, field units, districts, and agencies. Coordinate the setting of priorities for suppression in multiple 
fire situations considering safety, resource values and costs for suppression. Receives incident reports and 
initiates proper response. Provides a communication link to all firefighters and other field-going personnel.   
Compiles, organizes and reviews records.  Processes, interprets, and relays weather information.  Works with 
a number of fire-related computer applications such as ROSS and WildCAD.   
 
Specialty Area:  Lead Dispatcher – Provides leadership and direction to entry-level Initial Attack dispatchers 
and is responsible for dispatch operations in assigned zone. 
 
Minimum Qualifications: No previous wildland fire suppression experience required.  Must be able to read, 
write, and communicate effectively.  Must be able to learn to use multi-channel radios, multi-line phones, 
computers, keep accurate records, and read maps.  Must be capable of successfully completing training to 
qualify as a National Interagency Incident Management System (NIIMS) Initial Attach Dispatcher (IADP). Must 
be able to perform sedentary work in a high-stress environment for up to 16 hours per day with varying shifts 
and on-call periods.  Must be willing to work for up to 14 days at a time (required in some locations).  A valid 
driver's license may be required for some jobs.  Must be 18 years of age or older. 
 
 


