

ATTACHMENT 1 SCHEDULE A CONTRACT NO. 18-237 STAND BASED FOREST INVENTORY CRUISING				INLAND FOREST MANAGEMENT		COUGAR ENVIRONMENTAL		RYE TREE		TF FORESTRY		TIM JOHNSTON FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER	NUMBER OF	UNIT OF MEASURE	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT	TOTAL PRICE
Priest Lake	Priest Lake 2017 Stand Timber Cruise FM # 10-633-901-18 138 stands	1,353	Plots	\$ 37.49	\$ 50,723.97	\$ 37.49	\$ 50,723.97	\$ 58.33	\$ 78,920.49	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID
Pend Oreille Lake	POL 2017 SBI FM # 20-931-901-18 129 stands	1,238	Plots	\$ 26.33	\$ 32,596.54	\$ 25.99	\$ 32,175.62	\$ 46.66	\$ 57,765.08	\$ 36.00	\$ 44,568.00	\$ -	NO BID
Mica	Mica 2017 SBI FM # 22-168-901-18 66 stands	567	Plots	\$ 32.23	\$ 18,274.41	\$ 25.99	\$ 14,736.33	\$ 46.66	\$ 26,456.22	\$ 36.00	\$ 20,412.00	\$ -	NO BID
St. Joe	2017 St. Joe SBI FM # 30-792-901-18 227 stands	1,944	Plots	\$ 42.47	\$ 82,561.68	\$ 41.99	\$ 81,628.56	\$ 58.33	\$ 113,393.52	\$ 44.50	\$ 86,508.00	\$ -	NO BID
Clearwater	Clearwater 2017 Stand Timber Cruise FM # 40-1271-901-18 142 stands	1,315	Plots	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 37.99	\$ 49,956.85	\$ 58.33	\$ 76,703.95	\$ 44.50	\$ 58,517.50	\$ -	NO BID
Ponderosa	Ponderosa Stand Based Forest Inventory 2017 FM # 41-288-901-18 75 stands	873	Plots	\$ 26.48	\$ 23,117.04	\$ 37.99	\$ 33,165.27	\$ 46.66	\$ 40,734.18	\$ 42.00	\$ 36,666.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 21,825.00
Craig Mountain	2017 Stand Based Inventory FM # 42-231-901-16 58 stands	502	Plots	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 39.99	\$ 20,074.98	\$ 46.66	\$ 23,423.32	\$ 42.00	\$ 21,084.00	\$ -	NO BID
Maggie Creek	MC 2017 Stand Based Inventory FM # 42-166-901-11 90 stands	833	Plots	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 40.99	\$ 34,144.67	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 38.00	\$ 31,654.00	\$ -	NO BID