

18-244 SECURITY SERVICES

			2018		2019		2020	
QUALITY SERVICES Spirit Lake, Idaho	NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT TYPE	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
		624	Hours	\$ 44.80	\$ 27,955.20	\$ 45.50	\$ 28,392.00	\$ 46.25
	1	Hours	\$ 44.80	\$ 44.80	\$ 45.50	\$ 45.50	\$ 46.25	\$ 46.25
	Priest Lake Total:		\$ 28,000.00		Priest Lake Total:	\$ 28,437.50	Priest Lake Total:	\$ 28,906.25
	450	Hours	\$ 41.75	\$ 18,787.50	\$ 42.30	\$ 19,035.00	\$ 43.00	\$ 19,350.00
	1	Hours	\$ 41.75	\$ 41.75	\$ 42.30	\$ 42.30	\$ 43.00	\$ 43.00
	Pend Orielle Total:		\$ 18,829.25		Pend Orielle Total:	\$ 19,077.30	Pend Orielle Total:	\$ 19,393.00
KANIKSU SECURITY SPECIALIST, LLC Priest River, Idaho	NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT TYPE	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT	TOTAL EXTENDED AMOUNT
		624	Hours	\$ 54.87	\$ 34,238.88	\$ 54.87	\$ 34,238.88	\$ 54.87
	1	Hours	\$ 54.87	\$ 54.87	\$ 54.87	\$ 54.87	\$ 54.87	\$ 54.87
	Priest Lake Total:		\$ 34,293.75		Priest Lake Total:	\$ 34,293.75	Priest Lake Total:	\$ 34,293.75
	450	Hours	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	1	Hours	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Pend Orielle Total:		\$ -		Pend Orielle Total:	\$ -	Pend Orielle Total:	\$ -