

IDL RFQ QUOTE EVALUATION SHEET

**CONTRACT NO. 19-237-041003
GNA PANHANDLE NATIONAL FOREST COMMON STAND EXAM 2018**

**BUELL ENVIRONMENTAL LLC
OAK CREEK, CO 80467**

**PACE FOREST WORKS
AHSLAND OR 97520**

NATIONAL FOREST	PROJECT NAME	ACRES	STANDS	EXAM TYPE	EXAM LEVEL	NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEASURE	FIXED UNIT PRICE/PLOT	TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE	FIXED UNIT PRICE/PLOT	TOTAL EXTENDED PRICE
PANHANDLE	CHLORIDE GOLD	3059	42	FULL	1020	315	Plots	\$0.0000	NO BID	\$0.0000	NO BID
	COPPER JOHN	753	25	FULL	1000	139	Plots	\$48.9000	\$ 6,797.10	\$48.0000	\$ 6,672.00
	COPPER JOHN	471	14	LIGHT	1000	87	Plots	\$42.9000	\$ 3,732.30	\$44.0000	\$ 3,828.00
	HONEY BADGER	1405	28	FULL	1000	219	Plots	\$46.0000	\$ 10,074.00	\$0.0000	NO BID
	HONEY BADGER	2520	44	LIGHT	1000	360	Plots	\$41.0000	\$ 14,760.00	\$0.0000	NO BID
	LACY LEMOOSH	4556	107	FULL	1020	672	Plots	\$0.0000	NO BID	\$0.0000	NO BID