

BID EVALUATION CONTRACT NO. 19-237 2019 STAND BASED FOREST INVENTORY CRUISING				COUGAR ENVIRONMENTAL		RYE TREE SERVICE		FOREST RESOURCE SOLUTIONS		TIM JOHNSTON FORESTRY	
SUPERVISORY AREA	PROJECT NAME AND NUMBER	NUMBER OF UNITS	UNIT OF MEASURE	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE	FIXED UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
Priest Lake	Priest Lake 2019 SBI FM # 10-668-901-19 256 stands	1,728	Plots	\$ 37.47	\$ 64,748.16		NO BID	\$ 39.00	\$ 67,392.00	\$ -	NO BID
Pend Oreille Lake	POL 2019 SBI FM # 20-949-901-19 91 stands	882	Plots	\$ 32.98	\$ 29,088.36	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 25.75	\$ 22,711.50	\$ -	NO BID
Mica	Mica 2019 SBI FM # 22-182-901-19 79 stands	765	Plots	\$ 34.98	\$ 26,759.70	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID
St. Joe	2019 St. Joe SBI FM # 30-826-901-19 113 stands	1,419	Plots	\$ 47.98	\$ 68,083.62	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID
Clearwater	Clearwater 2019 SBI FM # 40-1298-901-19 247 stands	1,688	Plots	\$ 39.98	\$ 67,486.24	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	NO BID
Ponderosa	Ponderosa 2019 SBI FM # 41-318-901-19 40 stands	603	Plots	\$ 39.98	\$ 24,107.94	\$ 58.33	\$ 35,172.99	\$ -	NO BID	\$ 29.50	\$ 17,788.50
Craig Mountain	Craig Mtn 2019 SBI FM # 42-231-901-16 62 stands	424	Plots	\$ 41.49	\$ 17,591.76	\$ 58.33	\$ 24,731.92	\$ 37.99	\$ 16,107.76	\$ 39.50	\$ 16,748.00
Maggie Creek - Kamiah	MC-Kamiah 2019 SBI FM # 42-166-901-11 94 stands	889	Plots	\$ 41.49	\$ 36,884.61	\$ 62.66	\$ 55,704.74	\$ 34.95	\$ 31,070.55	\$ -	NO BID

ST JOE PROJECT 30-826-901-19 HAS BEEN CANCELLED. THE BID RECEIVED IS OVER ALLOCATION